Swapnil Sutar

From: riya sales <riya.salesO1@gmail.com>
Sent: 25 November 2024 13:13

To: Swapnil Sutar

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Rishabh Rawal
Subject: Re: Need quote luggage trolley Delhi

Hi Swapnil,

I accept the same.
Kindly release PO with 100% advance payment.

Thanks and regards
Rishabh Rawal

On Mon, 25 Nov 2024 at 1:09 PM, Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Rishabh,

As discussed, the target rate is X18,500/-.

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
B | & +91 9987022136

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



From: riya sales <riya.sales01@gmail.com>

Sent: 22 November 2024 21:39

To: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Rishabh Rawal <rawalrishabh6@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Need quote luggage trolley Delhi

Hi Swapnil,

Greetings from RIYA SALES !!

Fyi,
Luggage trolley - 19500/-

Pfa referral image below with size.

Thanks & Regards
Rishabh Rawal

RIYA SALES
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On Fri, Nov 22, 2024 at 2:38 PM Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote:

HI Sir,

Please arrange the quote...






Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
H| & +919987022136

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



