Abdul Rehman

From: Equipmart <equipmart@gmail.com>

Sent: 03 February 2024 11:29

To: Abdul Rehman

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; Lovejot Sekhon

Subject: Re: Shwarma Truck Lucknow Requirement

Attachments: WhatsApp Image 2024-02-03 at 11.08.13 AM.jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2024-02-03 at 11.08.14 AM.jpeg; Quotation - 599 Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited..pdf
Dear Sir,

Please find attached herewith the quotation for your reference.

Thanks & Regards,
Tarunya

On Sat, Feb 3, 2024 at 11:05 AM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@Xk-corp.in> wrote:

Hi

2

Request you to please share the quote for below mentioned equipment.

DIMENSIONS(L x W x
SR.No.|Eq.No.|DESCRIPTION MODEL NO [HT) QTY
TABLE TOP ELECTRIC INDULGE-
7 |CT-07 [SHWARMA MACHINE PE2 534 x 607 x 950 1
WATER PRESSURE PUMP MINI
20 |CT-20(SIZE SOE 1HP 1

Thanks & Regards,
Abdul Rehman
B | & +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: Abdul Rehman

Sent: 02 February 2024 20:10

Cec: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>
Subject: Shwarma Truck Lucknow Requirement




Hi,

Request you to kindly share the quote for below mentioned equipment.

DIMENSIONS(L x W x
SR.No.|Eq.No.|DESCRIPTION MODEL NO [HT) QTY
TABLE TOP ELECTRIC INDULGE-
7 |CT-07 |SHWARMA MACHINE PE2 534x 607 x950 1
WATER PRESSURE PUMP MINI
20 |CT-20|SIZE SOE 1HP 1

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

B | & +91 9920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

Kamalakshi Marketing Pvt. Ltd.

1/16 Kamal Mansion,

1st Floor, Near Radio Club

Arthur Bunder Road, Colaba,

Mumbai - 400 005.

Tel: +91 22 66359056/57/58 /+91 22 22041355

Email — equipmart@gmail.com

GST No - 27AAACKS8256H1ZC
UDYAM- MH-19-0234190

website: www.equipmart.in




