Swapnil Sutar

From: JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com>
Sent: 11 November 2024 19:08

To: Swapnil Sutar

Cc: Sandeep Bhat

Subject: Re: Need quote - Almirah 2 door 16-18-gauge ...

Ok sir , please process order. Delivery timeline please noted 20 to 25 days after payment.

On Mon, 11 Nov, 2024, 7:07 pm Swapnil Sutar, <swapnil.sutar@Xk-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Jagannath,

As discussed, we go ahead with 25,500+tax with inclusive freight charges.

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
B | & +91 9987022136

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com>
Sent: 11 November 2024 19:02

To: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Need quote - Almirah 2 door 16—18-gauge ...




Dear Sir,

Please find attached Quotation for your reference.

Material delivery timeline -20 to 25 days after payment.

On Mon, 11 Nov, 2024, 6:20 pm Swapnil Sutar, <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote:

Kolkata lounge

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
H | & +919987022136

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



From: JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com>
Sent: 11 November 2024 18:19

To: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Need quote - Almirah 2 door 16-18-gauge ...

Dear Sir,

Location ???

On Mon, 11 Nov, 2024, 6:17 pm Swapnil Sutar, <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please arrange the Quote for Almiraha Quote.

Almirah 2 door 16—18-gauge sheet heavy duty 72 x 24 x 36 Inch with 5 shelves

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar

B | & +919987022136



Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



