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Swapnil Sutar

From: InfoLED Lightings <infoled.h@gmail.com>
Sent: 28 March 2024 13:04
To: Swapnil Sutar
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Abdul Rehman
Subject: Re: 20 Induction repairing work - Mumbai Airport

Rs. 2000+18%GST 
 
On Wed, 27 Mar, 2024, 4:53 pm Swapnil Sutar, <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi Sir, 

  

Kindly share the rates for Induction repairing work at Mumbai Airport. 

  

Thanks & Regards, 

  

Swapnil Sutar 

📱 | ☎  +91 9987022136 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  


