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Vendor V0000424 1/3/2024 6:37:22 PM
No. Order Number P0/23-24/100098
MEPTEK CONSULTANTS
Parle West,Mumbai Suburban, Mumbai ,Maharashtra } . Invoice Location Corporate Address
Mumbai, 400056 Shipped Location
India Head Office Gmr Hospitality Limited
Head Office GMR Aero Towers,5th Floor
P.AN. No. ABVFM9245R Telangana, 500108 Shamshabad, Hyderabad,
State Code 27 IN 500108 Telangana
. 500108
State Name Maharashtra India N State 36
Vendor GST No. 27ABVEM9245R1ZX State Name Telangana
Dept. Name Contact Person Indent No
Vendor Email aparna.meptekK@gmail.com Contact No. HO PO No.
/nimish.shah@meptekconsultant
s.com
Vendor Phone 9833410610 /9372457760 Payment Terms HO PO Date
Total Tax Total Amount
SNo Item Code HSN\SAC Code Item Description UuoMm Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise Amount(ININR) (ININR)
1 FA000062 998311 MEP Design Fee(Hoegaarden /Corona Bar 40.00 2400372 18.00 0.00 0 96014.88
)DSHA-Bus
2 401132 Invoice Rounding 0.44 1 0.00 0.00 0 0.44
TAatal i+ 2 ANn1 27
Total INR 96,015.32
Excise Amount 0.00
SGST Amount 17,282.68
) Delivery schedule to be taken from the Buyer before d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST Charges Amount 0.00
Despatching the mater INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE DELIVERY
ADDRESS.
e) The Payment of taxes will be Released once the Taxes is
Credited to our Account or the GST Portal
Total INR Incl. Taxes 113,297.56

Terms:-
1. 25% - Advance : along with the letter of Intent / Work-order|

2. 25% - Concept Design Stage : on submission of conceptual DBR and all
required

drawings & documents for authority approvals|

3. 25% - GFC Stage : upon finalization and issue of all GFCs|

4. 15% - Construction Stage : on completion of low side works at site|

5. 10 % - Handover Stage : balance at the time of completion & HO of the project
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Sarvesh Patil

From: Nimish Shah <nimish.shah@meptekconsultants.com>

Sent: 07 December 2023 12:30

To: Binu Balachandran

Cc: Stephen P; Sarvesh Patil; Sonali Dhadve; 'Dev Joel’; 'DIL BAG SINGH PHAL SWAL'; 'Shadab
Sukri'; Lovejot Sekhon; Jogeswar Sahu

Subject: RE: HYD - Consultancy

Attachments: MEP Design Proposal_23_98_TFS_HYD.pdf

Dear Binu,

PFA — MEP Design Fee proposal for Hyderabad Airport project, as per details given.
Let me know in case of any query.
With Best regards,

Nimish Shah
Cell # 9833410610

M=PTEK
CONSULTANTS

209, Sumer Kendra, Behind Mahindra Towers,
Pandurang Budhkar Marg, Worli,
Mumbai - 400018

From: Binu Balachandran [mailto:binu.balachandran@k-corp.in]

Sent: Tuesday, December 5, 2023 11:14 AM

To: nimish.shah@meptekconsultants.com

Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>; Dev Joel <Dev.Joel@gmrgroup.in>; DIL BAG SINGH PHAL SWAL
<DILBAG.SINGHPHALSWAL@gmrgroup.in>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu

<jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: HYD - Consultancy

Dear Nimish,

As discussed with you kindly send your quotation for MEP design services for below outlet.

S.No. Location Old Area by Area (Sqft) Proposed Brands Unit Code GMR Unit Code MEP
Projects
5 DSHA - Bus Gate 223 2400.372 Hoegaarden /Corona Bar Concept 31 CF 003
10 Kitchen /BOH 250 2691 Kitchen /BOH
11 Store Store
Regards

Binu Balachandran
+91-8452876061

From: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2023 5:33 PM

To: Anil Kumar Nallur <anil@muffin-d.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Dev Joel
<Dev.Joel@gmrgroup.in>; DIL BAG SINGH PHAL SWAL <DILBAG.SINGHPHALSWAL@gmrgroup.in>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-

corp.in>
Subject: HYD - Consultancy

Dear sir,
Please review the attached document for upcoming projects in HYD. We've included your lump-sum amounts. Please verify on your end and confirm.
Thanks & Regards,

Jogeswar Sahu
+91 9082949517



