
Sr. No Item Description UOM Qty Rate Amount Rate Amount Rates Amount

1
USB 

Wireless 
Mouse

USB Wireless Mouse Nos 15 485 7275 650.00 9750.00 550.00 8250.00

7275.00 9750.00 8250.00

1309.50 1755.00 1485.00

8584.50 11505.00 9735.00

GST Amount : 18%

Sub Total Amount

LAKSH IT Solutions TYYPA

Basic Amount

Sai Edge Solutions



Organization Name:
Customer Contact Person:
Email:

Delivery Location
Quotation Number

Quotation Date:

Sr.No. Description Qty Unit Price (INR) Ext.Price GST% GST Amount Total (INR)

1 Logitech Wireless Mouse-M171 15 485.00 7275.00 18% 1309.50 8584.50

7,275.00INR  1,309.50INR  8,584.50INR  

SES-IMPL One Time Installation Charges 1 EXTRA

SES-AMC Annual Maintenance / Uptime support 1 NA

7,275.00INR  1,309.50INR  8,584.50INR  

Taxes

Price Validity

Delivery Time

Payment Terms
Ordering information

GSTIN

OPTIONAL - SES Services Cost >>>

Total Cost  (A+ B+C)   >>>

WARRANTY CONTRACTS / SUBSCRIPTION PACKS  - B

Warranty COST INR >>>

SES - SERVICES - optional - C

100 % advance along with PO
Order to be placed on "Sai Edge Solutions"

27APCPR6783E1ZJ

Terms and Conditions

GST Included as mentioned

1 week
1 to 2 weeks 

   
PRODUCTS - A

Product Cost INR >>>

Mr. Herambraj Sonawane
mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in

Mumbai
2024-25-346

16 October 2024

QUOTATION

Travel Food Services
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Sonali Dhadve

From: Sharad - Tyypa Infotech <sharad@tyypa.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2024 6:51 PM
To: Sonali Dhadve
Cc: Nilesh Gandhi; Herambraj Sonawane
Subject: RE: required qutation  : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : Semolina-2425-01008 and USB Wireless Mouse

Importance: High

Dear Sir, 
 

Line 
No 

Item 
Code 

Item Name UOM Qty 
Price Per Unit  

1 
USB 
Mouse 

USB Wireless Mouse 
Logitech M170 

NOS 15.00 
550+GST Extra  

 
 
Regards,  
Sharad khot 9768379871 
Tyypa Infotech 
sharad@tyypa.com 
Mumbai Grant Road (East)  
                                                                                                                                                                  
 

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>  
Sent: 15 October 2024 17:58 
Cc: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in> 
Subject: required qutation : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : Semolina-2425-01008 and USB Wireless Mouse 
 
Hello, 
 
Please see below requirement and share quotation .  
 
 

Line No Item Code Item Name UOM Qty 

1 USB Mouse USB Wireless Mouse NOS 15.00 



2

 
 
 
 
 
Thanks & Regards 
Sonali D  
 

From: no-reply@procuresens.com <no-reply@procuresens.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2024 9:48 AM 
To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in> 
Subject: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : Semolina-2425-01008 and USB Wireless Mouse 
 

Dear Sonali Dhadve, 

New Purchase Request is assigned to you. Below are the details 

PR Details as below : 

PR Number: Semolina-2425-01008 

PR Description: USB Wireless Mouse 

PR Total Amount: 0.00 

Requested by: Praful Surve 

Requested Date and Time: 14/10/2024 12:28:44 

Approved Date and Time: 14/10/2024 13:26:01 

Department: $Department$ 

List of PR Line Items 

Line No Item Code Item Name UOM Qty 
Unit 
Price 

Net 
Amount 

1  USB Wireless 
Mouse 

NOS 15.00 0.00 0.00 
 

E-Procurement System 
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E-Procurement System 


