Shyam Enterprises

OS Interiors

Sr. No. |ITEM UNIT |QTY RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT
32,000.00 39,000.00

Plumbing work for

1 basement sink area, drain Nos 1 8000 8000 10000 10000
jali-06, Cpvc Pipe including
Making new pipeline for

2 common toilet as broken Nos 1 8000 8000 9000 9000
due to tottaly rusty
Basement kitchen tilling

3 work Behind tandoor tilling | Nos 1 16000 16000 20000 20000

work




Mob. :- 9819919946

‘ SHYAM ENTERPR.SE 9819919936

CIVIL CARPENTERING, ELECTRIC, POP WORK, PAINTING
ALL TYPES FURNITURE WORK
GST No:. 27BBRPP9992H1ZJ / PAN: BBRPP9992H

Date: 28/09/2024
To,

KAPCO BANQUETS AND CATERING PRIVATE LIMITED

Site :
Blue sea
Worli
Sub : Quotation for plumbing work
Sr. .
No Particulars Qty. Rate Amount
1 P!umt?lng w'ork for basement sink area, drain jali-06, Cpvc 1 8000 8000
Pipe including
5 Making new pipeline for common toilet as broken due to L 8000 8000
tottaly rusty
3 Behind tanddor and near old pot wash area new tilling work 1 16000 16000
TOTAL AMOUNT 32000

Note :.
% 70% Advance Payment
+« Extra Work will Extra Charges.

®,

«» GST will be applicable.

For SHYAM ENTERPRISE

W

37¢ Floor Room No, 301, B/18, Saidham CHS. Ltd., Near Santi Vidya Nagari, Mira Road (E), Thane - 401107
E-mail ID :- shyamenterprise021@gmail.com
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Mr. Ajay Jadhav £ Mobile No - 97735 97150

R P o _
Email-osinteriors11@gmail.com

OS INTERIORS

Gala No - 29, Mangalmurti Rahivasi Seva Sang. Aadharsh Nager. Kandivli(West). Mumbai - 400 067.
Specialist in-Maintenance and Project

Client Name - Blue sea
Client Address - Harish sir Quotation No - 384
Contact No -
Mail ID - Date - 29-09-2024
SUB:- Repairing work
Sr. . .
NOS Particulars Unit | Qty. Rate Amount
1 N . . . L/S 1 10000 10000
Common washroom new pipe line with using ¢ pvc pipe
2 |Pot wash area plumbing work with require matrerials L/S 1 9000 9000
Basement and main kitchen near tandoor tilling work L/S 1 20000 20000
Total Amount 39000
Taxes 18%
Grand Total

Payment Terms- 50% Advance along with work order

We hope you will find our offer in this line & look forward for your valuable order.

Yours faithfully

THANK YOU FOR YOUR OFFER!



mailto:Email-osinteriors11@gmail.com

Capex Purchase

From: Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>

Sent: 30 September 2024 15:46

To: Capex Purchase; Harish Tirlotkar

Cc: Pravin Takle; Shashikant Vishwakarma

Subject: Re: Quotation for Common toilet plumbing work and tilling work

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

OK to go ahead

Thank you

Regards
Ashay Desai
Director - Culinary and Operations

From: Capex Purchase <capex.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>

Date: Monday, 30 September 2024 at 2:48 PM

To: Harish Tirlotkar <maintenance@kapcocatering.com>

Cc: Pravin Takle <pravin.takle@kapcocatering.com>, Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>,
Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Quotation for Common toilet plumbing work and tilling work

Dear Harish,

As you confirmed in below trail mail the said work has been started already,
so | need approval of Akshay Sir for release order on Shyam enterprises.

Thanks & Regards
Pramod Singh
9769548806

From: Harish Tirlotkar <maintenance@kapcocatering.com>

Sent: 30 September 2024 11:53

To: Capex Purchase <capex.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Pravin Takle <pravin.takle@kapcocatering.com>

Subject: Quotation for Common toilet plumbing work and tilling work

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Pramod, As discussed PFA quotations for plumbing work and civil work.



Also said work we know whenever breaking flooring so we start the same with Shyam enterprises so
request you to make PO with Shyam enterprises.

Ashay sir and Pravin sir is aware about that.

Thanks & Regards,
Harish



	Comparative.pdf
	Shyam Enterprises.pdf
	OS Interiors.pdf
	Approval_mail.pdf

