Comfort Kitchen Shree Manek Kitchen AR equipment L1 Riya Sales
Description Dimension |Qty Rate Amt Rate Amt Rate Amt Rate Amt
SS 2 Tier Bussi

Tmue;er SIS [39%02.5X35 1 17000 17000 21500 21500 15000 15000 14500 14500
Basic Total 17000 21500 15000 14500
Freight Charge 6000 As per Actual 6000 6000
GST 4140 3870 3780 3690
Total Amount 27140 25370 24780 24190




Capex Purchase

From: riya sales <riya.salesO1@gmail.com>

Sent: 13 June 2024 13:13

To: Capex Purchase

Cc: Santosh. Sawant K-Corp; Sonali Dhadve; Swapnil Sutar
Subject: Re: 2 Tier Bussing Trolley Requirement.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Team,

Freight charges would be 6000/- + GST.
Kindly release P.O. to start production asap.

THANKS AND REGARDS
RISHABH RAWAL
RIYA SALES

Riya Sales

mercial Kitchen Equipments « Food Service Equipments
entse Hotels Equipments & Hospitals Equipments

On Thu, Jun 13, 2024 at 9:27 AM Capex Purchase <capex.purchase@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

As discussed material will deliver at Lucknow Airport, Kindly share the freight amount for the same.

Thanks & Regards

Pramod Singh

9769548806



From: riya sales <riya.sales01@gmail.com>

Sent: 11 June 2024 18:28

To: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>

Cc: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Rishabh Rawal <rawalrishabh6@gmail.com>; Sandeep Bhat
<sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Subject: 2 Tier Bussing Trolley Requirement.

Hi Swapnil,

Greetings from RIYA SALES !!

Pfa price for 2 Tier Bussing Trolley.

Kindly release p.o. to start production asap.

Outlet Name |EQ SR. No DESCRIPTION OVERALL SIZE| Model No |QTY
L]LSSLR?I 1 2 Tier Bussing Trolley 38X22.5X35 CUSTOM MAKE | 1

THANKS AND REGARDS

RISHABH RAWAL

RIYA SALES




o

COMFORT KITCHEN

SY 216/1,BANDAPURA VILLAGE & MAIN ROAD,MARSUR POST,ANEKAL TALUK,BANGALORE-562016

Mobile : +91 - 9741406252, +91- 8220007697
E - mail : sales@comfortkitchen.in

Quote No : CK.SA.04.24.29 Date : 20-04-2024

Quote To : Deliver To :

M/s. Travel Food Services M/s. Travel Food Services
Bangalore Bangalore

As per your requirements we are please to present our quotation for KITCHEN EQUIPMENTS

DIMENSIONS IN MM
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT RATE AMOUNT GST AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

LENGTH WIDTH HEIGHT

UTILITY TROLLEY -2 TIER “nn 17000 17,000.00 3,060.00 20,060.00

17,000.00 3,060.00 20,060.00

General Terms And Conditions

GST And Other Taxes: Added

Delivery: 15 Days From The Date of Purchase Order and Advance.

Freight charges: Extra As Actual

Scope of Work: Supply and Installation of above Equipments ( Civil, Electrical, Plumbing works Doesn’t comes under our scope we only submit you the requirement )
Quotation Valid: Up To 30 Days

Payment Terms: 70 % Advance Along With PO, 30%- Before Delivery

Warranty : One Year Against Any Manufacturing Defects ( Wear and Tear Items Like wire, Wheels, Coils, Switches Doesn't Comes under Warranty )

We trust the same is in order. In case you need any further clarifications please feel free to get in touch with us. We look forward to your valuable order.

FOR COMFORT KITCHEN

Authorized signatory




Shree Manek Kitchen Equipments Pvt. Ltd.

Manufacturer of Hotel Kitchen Equipment
7, Udyog Nagar, Plot No. 7, Off. S.V.Road, Near Vifor (India),

SHREE MANEK Goregaon (west), Mumbai-400062, M -9820757187
SMART COOKING SOLUTION E-Mail:info@shreemanek.net Website: www.shreemanek.net
QUOTATION
M/S Travel Food Services Pvt Ltd-Semolina Quotation No : SMK /7 Q /007_1/ 2024 - 25
Quotation Date : 19.04.2024
Kind Attn : Swapnil Suthar (9987022136)

Dear Sir,

With reference to your mail we are pleased to submit our most competitive offer for kitchen equipments completely in Stainless Steel 304
quality finish material for your kind consideration, as under:

Eqp. L .

Sr No. ,\?(I)O Description Overall Size Qty Rate Amount

1 1 |Utility Trolley 36" x 24" x 36" Height 1 21,500/- 21500
1. PRICE : Nett Ex. Factory TOTAL AMOUNT 21,500/
2. PAYMENT: 50% Advance along with order, balance against inspection
prior to dispatch.
3. DELIVERY : Within 2 to 3 Weeks
4. Transportation Charges and unloading will be paid by client G.S.T. 18% 3,870/-
5.G.S.T: 18% Included 6.VALIDITY : 15 Days
7.INSPECTION : At our end before dispatch FINAL AMOUNT 25,370/-
WARRANTY:

Equipments made by us to the best of our knowledge are free from all defects and faulty workmanship.
The following warrantees and conditions are applicable:

*1 Year from the date of delivery/dispatch

This warranty covers replacement parts only and includes electrical parts, thermostat, valve and fittings
This warranty covers leak or burn out of metal body equipments

CONDITIONS:

The above warranty is void under following conditions:

1. Improper installation or operation of equipment

2. Abuse or Neglect (including failure to clean periodically)

All repairs and/ or replacements are subject to our decision that the workmanship or parts were faulty
and that the defects showed up under normal use. All claims under this warranty must be submitted

to us before return of the unit to our factory. No units will be accepted without prior authorization.
Unit must be dispatched with freight pre-paid and will be returned upon collecting freight.



A.R.EQUIPMENTS

EER_

-  EOUIPMEMNTS

LS QuaLTY CormmeERciaL KITomEN EQuUimmsnTs

<>

I1ISO 9001: 2015 Cortifiod Company

Registred Off:

Plot No. PL 06/324, Umer Compound Industrial, Survey No.94,Nalasopara Phata (East),

Dist. Phalghar, Maharashtra - 401209
Mob : 9820246813 Office No :- 9561233926
Email: arequipments.1615@gmail.com Web : www.arequipments.net.in

GSTIN: 27A00PV9027J1Z3

Ref.N0.ARE/3885/2023-2024 Date
ATTN : Mr_Swapnil Sutar PROJECT : Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited 19/Apr/24
Contact No: 9987022136
Quotation of S.S Kitchen Equipments
Respected sir, we thank for below mentioned enquiry and have pleasure in submitting our competative offer.
Overall Size in Inches Qty MAKE & MODEL RATE AMOUNT Taxable Value :S;r Amount Total Cost
ate
1 SS TROLLY FOR USED OIL TRANSPORTATION 36x24x36 1 15,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00| 18% 2,700.00 17,700.00
15,000.00 2,700.00 17,700.00
TOTAL IN WORDS Freight Charges Extra at actual
SEVENTEEN THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED RUPEES ONLY Packing Charges Extra atactual

Ceritified that the particulars given above are true and correct

Bank Details Invoice Total 17,700.00
Bank Name: |ICICI BANK LTD
BankA/C:  |139405500635 Name: A.R.EQUIPMENTS
Bank IFSC:  |ICIC0001394 Branch: VASAI (East) A.R.EQUIPMENTS

Common Seal

Authorised signatory

General Terms & Condition:

1. Validity of Quote: 15 Days form the date of submission.
a) GST : As actual

b) Transport and Freight Charges as per actual

c) Installation Charge and site visit charges will be borne by buyer as per actual.
d) Loading : Unloding Expenses including union expenses / charges (e.g.mathadi Kamdar union ) will be borne by buyer.

e) Inspection : At our works Before dispatch.

f) Delivery : 15 to 20 working days along with confirmation order & due advance.

g) Delivery of Imported Product: 15 to 20 Days

4. Payment for Manufacturing Products : 60% advance with confirmation order and 20% after start the production and balance 20% after inspection.

4 a) Imported Equipments :- 100% Advance

5. Once Oder Placed will not be cancelled or if cancelled, charges will be applied

6). Warranty :-

i) 1 year from the date of delivery for leak or burn out of metal body & Compressor.
ii) 90 days from the date of delivery for replacement of parts which includes electrical elements, thermostat and gas components meters,

valves fitting etc.

iii) Glass & plastic parts, blades, rubber parts, bulbs, are not covered under guarantee/warranty. Also this warranty is covering only the
manufacturing defects and shall not cover any loss or damage due to either miss handling or miss using of the product or damage due to the

products/parts due to negligence.
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