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Abdul Rehman

From: comfort kitchen <comfortkitchenblr@gmail.com>
Sent: 14 June 2024 12:53
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; Ramendra Singh; sampath kumar
Subject: Re: SS Racks - Chennai
Attachments: Quote - SS Storage Rack - TFS _Chennai- 14-06-2024-R1.pdf

Dear Sir 
 
  Kindly find the attachment for the SS Storage Rack revised quotation for TFS Chennai. 
 
 

 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Sarathi.S 
 
COMFORT KITCHEN 
 
Sy170/3,Bandapura Village & main road, 
 
Marsur Post,Anekal Taluk 
 
Bangalore - 562106 
 
+91-9686176252, +91-9741406252  
 
sales@comfortkitchen.in 
 
http://www.comfortkitchen.in/ 
 
 
On Thu, Jun 13, 2024 at 10:14 PM comfort kitchen <comfortkitchenblr@gmail.com> wrote: 
Dear Sir 
 
  Please share the Rack quantity to workout the target price. 
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Thanks & Regards, 
 
Sarathi.S 
 
COMFORT KITCHEN 
 
Sy170/3,Bandapura Village & main road, 
 
Marsur Post,Anekal Taluk 
 
Bangalore - 562106 
 
+91-9686176252, +91-9741406252  
 
sales@comfortkitchen.in 
 
http://www.comfortkitchen.in/ 
 
 
On Thu, Jun 13, 2024 at 7:03 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Sampath Ji,  

  

Target price for this is 30000 per rack. Request you to kindly share your no regret price.  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
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From: comfort kitchen <comfortkitchenblr@gmail.com>  
Sent: 06 June 2024 21:14 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; sampath kumar <sales@comfortkitchen.in> 
Subject: Re: SS Racks - Chennai 

  

Dear Sir 

  

  Kindly find the attachment for the SS Storage Rack quotation for TFS Chennai. 
 

 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Sarathi.S 
 
COMFORT KITCHEN 
 
Sy170/3,Bandapura Village & main road, 
 
Marsur Post,Anekal Taluk 

  

Bangalore - 562106 
 
+91-9686176252, +91-9741406252  
 
sales@comfortkitchen.in 
 
http://www.comfortkitchen.in/ 
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On Thu, Jun 6, 2024 at 1:01 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Partners,  

  

Request you to kindly share quote for SS storage racks. Photos attached for reference for Chennai Location.   

  

Purchase Group Category Sub Category Item Name QTY 

F01 EQUIPMENTS EQUIPMENTS 

Item - Making and fixing SS racks in 
SS 304 material. As per the approved 
Dwg & on site engg  
Size inch - 55" X 22.5" X 53" 1 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  


