Abdul Rehman

From: comfort kitchen <comfortkitchenblr@gmail.com>

Sent: 25 July 2024 14:43

To: Abdul Rehman

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; sampath kumar

Subject: Re: Manesar dhaba Fabricated requirement

Attachments: Quote -Kitchen Equipments - TFS_Manesar dhaba - 25-07-2024.pdf
Dear Sir

Kindly find the attachment for the Kitchen equipment's quotation.

Thanks & Regards,

Sarathi.S

COMFORT KITCHEN
Sy170/3,Bandapura Village & main road,
Marsur Post,Anekal Taluk

Bangalore - 562106

+91-9686176252, +91-9741406252

sales@comfortkitchen.in

http://www.comfortkitchen.in/

On Thu, Jul 25, 2024 at 11:25 AM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Partners,



Need quote for below mentioned equipment for our upcoming outlet in Manesar.

S. Equipment Dimensions
No. | “4%P Qty | Category
3 SS STAND WITH TWO SHELVES 1050Wx600Dx600H+50 y Fabrication
BELOW HIGH
10 SS WORKING TABLE WITH TWO 900Wx700Dx850H+50 y Fabrication
SHELVES BELOW HIGH
13 SS WORKING TABLE WITH TWO 400Wx700Dx850H+50 y Fabrication
SHELVES BELOW HIGH
16 SS PARTITION 600Wx300H 1 Fabrication
24 MS STAND (LOW HT.) AS/SPEC. 1200Wx450DX100H 2 Fabrication
26 | SS TROLLY with castor wheels 450Wx450DX850H 1 Fabrication
32 OGT 600 x 400 x 400 1 OGT

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

B | & +91 9920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.




