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Abdul Rehman

From: Abhijit Saha <abhijitsahabangalore@gmail.com>
Sent: 03 September 2024 00:20
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Ranjandas S; Shreedhar Babu R; Ashish Bakshi; Shama Nair; Dominic Gerard; Rajesh Shetty
Subject: Re: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender

Dear Abdul, 
 
That will not be possible as the length of Bluestar BC350A is small. 
However it is possible to replace the Elanpro CGN 3100TNG with 2nos of Celfrost BB201/ 201SS or BB 201 Dlx/201 SS Dlx. See attachments for more details. 
 
Please note that for these models of Back Bar Bottle Coolers a civil slab is required above them.  
 
Best 
Abhijit Saha 
 
 
 
 
On Sat, Aug 31, 2024 at 2:01 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Ahijit, 

  

For Item no 10 in the Bar 1 - Elanpro CGN 3100TNG instead of Elan pro can we go ahead with Bluestar BC350A Back bar chiller Dimension – 1350 x 520 x 900 (WxDxH).  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
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From: Abhijit Saha <abhijitsahabangalore@gmail.com>  
Sent: 20 August 2024 19:02 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Cc: Shreedhar Babu R <shreedhar@bialairport.com>; Ashish Bakshi <ashish.b@bialairport.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Dominic Gerard 
<dominic.gerard@blrlounge.in>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender 

  

Dear All, 

  

Please proceed with the following: 

  

For Item no 10 in the Bar 1 - Elanpro CGN 3100TNG 

https://elanpro.net/product/cgn-3100tng/ 

  

For Item no 9 in the Live Kitchen - RTDW-137MS4-33 (Drawer UC Chiller)  

https://www.westernequipments.com/product.html 

  

The Updated BOQ is also attached herewith incorporating the above. 

  

Best 

Abhijit Saha 
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On Tue, Aug 20, 2024 at 11:10 AM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> wrote: 

Gentle reminder-1 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 

  

From: Ranjandas S  
Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2024 3:07 pm 
To: Abhijit Saha <abhijitsahabangalore@gmail.com>; Shreedhar Babu R <shreedhar@BIALAIRPORT.COM> 
Cc: Ashish Bakshi <ashish.b@bialairport.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Dominic Gerard 
<dominic.gerard@blrlounge.in>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender 

  

Dear Chef, 

  

Request to check and clarify the trial mail query of Bar and Live kitchen equipment. Your early response is highly appreciable. 
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Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 

  

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>  
Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2024 2:42 pm 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar 
<swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Dominic Gerard <dominic.gerard@blrlounge.in>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; 
binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Santosh. Sawant K-Corp <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri 
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan 
<saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Ranjan ji, 

  

As discussed you on call, PFB 2 line items where we are facing confusion in placing the order.  

  

1)      For code 10 item in description mentioned is BACK BAR CHILLER 3 DOOR but the model no mentioned is of 3 door under counter chiller.  

2)      For code 9 item in description mentioned is 2 DOOR U.C. CHILLER WITH SPLASH but the model no mentioned is of 6 drawer under counter chiller.  
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Request you to please confirm what exactly is required so we can go ahead and place the order.  

  

  

CODE DESCRIPTION OF EQUIPMENTS BOQ QTY  Dimension LxWxH MAKE MODEL 

10 BACK BAR CHILLER 3 DOOR 1 1800x600x850 Hoshizaki RTW 186 LS4 GD 

9 2 DOOR U.C. CHILLER WITH SPLASH  1 1300x700x850 Hoshizaki RTDW 137 MS4 33 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>  
Sent: 01 August 2024 10:09 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-
corp.in>; Dominic Gerard <dominic.gerard@blrlounge.in>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman 
<abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender 

  

Dear Abdul, 
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I think you need the specification of equipment and isometric drawing of fabricated equipment. Shop drawing to be made by vendor not consultant. Will ask the specification and isometric 
drawing from Consultant. 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 

  

From: Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2024 5:39 pm 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-
Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Dominic Gerard <dominic.gerard@blrlounge.in>; Rohan 
Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; 
binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Santosh. Sawant K-Corp <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in> 
Subject: RE: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender 

  

++Ranjandas Sir 

  

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>  
Sent: 31 July 2024 17:09 
To: Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Santosh. Sawant K-Corp <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-
Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Dominic Gerard <dominic.gerard@blrlounge.in>; Rohan 
Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in> 
Subject: RE: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Smrutika, 

  

As previously mentioned, we are still waiting for the tender document and shop drawing of the fabricated equipment. 

  

Please share these documents by tomorrow to proceed further. If we do not receive them by then, the PR will be rejected. 

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 24 July 2024 18:13 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat 
<sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Dominic Gerard <dominic.gerard@blrlounge.in>; Rohan 
Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in> 
Subject: RE: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender 
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Dear Team, 

  

Following PR uploaded for BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen 

  

        Equipment - BLR-2425-00105 

        SOE - BLR-2425-00106 

        Additional ID - BLR-2425-00104 

  

Please Process PO 

  

Regards, 

Smrutika 

  

From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>  
Sent: 24 July 2024 14:36 
To: Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-
Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Dominic Gerard <dominic.gerard@blrlounge.in>; Rohan 
Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in> 
Subject: BLR-T1-DOM Lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipment tender 

  

Dear Smrutika, 
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Please find attached herewith the tender documents of BLR T1 domestic lounge ph-2 Kitchen equipments. Please upload this in Safal. 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 
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