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Prime

I\A’IIChen cas®

Proforma Invoice
PI' NO. PKC_2401050

To,

K Hospitality Corp

1 Rashid Mansion

Worli Point, Mumbai - 400018, India

DATE: 16/01/2024

Date of Inspection :
Inspected By:
Our GSTN:27AAPFP3057R1ZC

Kind Attn:
Dear Sir,
we are pleased to append below our prices for your kind consideration,
Sl. Description HSN/SAC Qty. Rate Total
1 Door locking type gasket for KFC Vertical hot cabinet 84199090 4 18105.00 72420.00
(PART NO-23796)
Total 72,420.00
Taxable Value 72,420.00
GST 18% 13,035.60
Round off (-) 0.40
SUM Total 85,456.00

NOTE: This quotation is based on initial inspection / service request of the unit, if during rectification / service any other parts found

faulty will be charge extra.

Terms & Conditions:- Bank Details:-

Price: Ex Stock Mumbai PRIME KITCHEN CARE
Payment: 100% advance A/C No: 00009350506094
Credit Period: N/A IFSC: HDFC0001573
Validity of PI: 15 days Bank: HDFC Bank

Lead Time: 5 Day Branch: Kalina, Mumbai

We look forward to your valuable response and it will be always our plesure to offer our best services.



Prime

I\A’IIChen cas®

Proforma Invoice
PI' NO. PKC_2401050

To,

K Hospitality Corp

1 Rashid Mansion

Worli Point, Mumbai - 400018, India

DATE: 16/01/2024

Date of Inspection :
Inspected By:
Our GSTN:27AAPFP3057R1ZC

Kind Attn:
Dear Sir,
we are pleased to append below our prices for your kind consideration,
Sl. Description HSN/SAC Qty. Rate Total
1 Door locking type gasket for KFC Vertical hot cabinet 84199090 4 18105.00 72419.80
(PART NO-23796)
Total 72,419.80
Discount @20% 14,484.00
Taxable Value 57,935.80
GST 18% 10,428.44
Round off (-) 0.24
SUM Total 68,364.00

NOTE: This quotation is based on initial inspection / service request of the unit, if during rectification / service any other parts found

faulty will be charge extra.

Terms & Conditions:- Bank Details:-

Price: Ex Stock Mumbai PRIME KITCHEN CARE
Payment: 100% advance A/C No: 00009350506094
Credit Period: N/A IFSC: HDFC0001573
Validity of PI: 15 days Bank: HDFC Bank

Lead Time: 5 Day Branch: Kalina, Mumbai

We look forward to your valuable response and it will be always our plesure to offer our best services.



Capex Purchase

From: Service prime <service@primekitchencare.com>
Sent: 16 January 2024 16:42

To: Capex Purchase

Cc: 'Prime Kitchen Care'; nehal@primekitchencare.com
Subject: RE: Requirement of Door Gasket For TFSPL - Goa
Attachments: P1.No.50.pdf; P.No.50_Revised.pdf

You don't often get email from service@primekitchencare.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Prime Kitchen Care.

Reference to discussion with Mr. Vheejy Pawar sir, enclosed here amended Pl with 20% discounted rate.
Afsana Shaikh

Thanks & Regards

P .

312, Building No. 11

Motilal Nehru Nagar, BKC, Bandra(E)
Mumbai.400051, Maharashtra, India
tel:+91-7400071333

service@primekitchencare.com
www.primekitchencare.com

From: Capex Purchase <capex.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 16 January 2024 15:47

To: service@nejyra.com; support@nejyra.com

Subject: RE: Requirement of Door Gasket For TFSPL - Goa

Dear Sir / Madam,

As we discussed please share revised rate for the same.

Thanks & Regards
Pramod Singh
9801387143

From: Capex Purchase
Sent: 13 January 2024 13:02



To: service@nejyra.com; support@nejyra.com
Subject: Requirement of Door Gasket For TFSPL - Goa

Dear Sir,

We have a requirement of Door gasket for Goa airport.
Kindly share your quote as per below details-

Item: Door locking type gasket for KFC Vertical hot cabinet
ALTOSHAAM (USA) MODEL 1200-UP/SR, PART NO-23796
Qty: 4/-

Thanks & Regards
Pramod Singh
9801387143



THE HOSPITALITY SOLUTION

bl S Commercial Kitchen Equipments Sales & Service
To,
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PVT LTD.
Gao Airport, Dabolim, Date: 05/01/2024
Goa-

Kind Attn: Mr. SARVESH/Mr. CLEYTON
Subject: Quote for KFC ALTOSHAAM HOT CABINET DOOR GASKET.
Dear Sarvesh & Clayton,

As per telephone conversation with Mr. Aziz regarding his requirement of spare parts for KFC HOT ALTOSHAAM
HOT CABINET. Here we are sharing our best quote for the same.
1) Towards the charges for supplying import door locking type gasket for KFC Vertical hot cabinet

Make: ALTOSHAAM (USA) MODEL- 1200'UP/SR, PART NO-23796
Rs. 34,500.00 X 04 = Rs. 1, 38,000.00

2) IGST@18% EXTRA

NOTE:

i) 100% advance payment.

ii) PO and payment should be on the name of M/s. The Hospitality Solution.
iii) Order for material will be made after receiving of PO and Payment.

iv) The above quote is only for supply of spares no installation charges include.
V) Delivery time at least 15-20 working DAYS after PO and Advance payment.

vi) 18% IGST extra.
vii) HSN CODE-8419

Kindly go through the above quote and let me know your valuable feedback.
Assuring you of our best services at all the time.

M/s. The Hospitality Solution.
Thanks
Regards

A.khan
(Sr. Service Eng)

210-A & 116-Option Primo, Opp. Maruti Service Center, Near Passport Office, MIDC, Andheri (E), Mumbai - 400 093

Mob.: 9819104761, Email : thehospitalitysolution@gmail.com
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