Swapnil Sutar

From: Pankaj Sakarkar <pankajsakarkar@bluestarindia.com>

Sent: 12 February 2024 10:08

To: Swapnil Sutar

Cc: Abdul Rehman; Sandeep Bhat

Subject: RE: Ice Cube Machine for lounge AHM airport Semolina-2324-00408
Importance: High

Dear Swapnil,

Pls find below quote for Ice machine.
ICM26 - 30000+GST

ICM50 - 45000+GST

All other terms and condition remain same.

Regards
Pankaj

From: Swapnil Sutar [mailto:swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in]

Sent: Thursday, February 8, 2024 6:42 PM

Cc: Abdul Rehman; Sandeep Bhat

Subject: Ice Cube Machine for lounge AHM airport Semolina-2324-00408

CAUTION: ** This mail has been sent from outside Blue Star. Please open attachments/links after validating credentials. **

Dear Partner,
Please quote for ice machine.

Ice Cube Machine 30 Kg

Thanks & Regards,



Swapnil Sutar
B | & +91 9987022136
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



