Sarvesh Patil

From: Bright Roadlines <brightroadlinesmumbai@gmail.com>
Sent: 10 September 2024 17:28

To: Sarvesh Patil

Cc: Stephen P; Pushpak Shewale

Subject: Re: 8ft Tempo Charges (Haryana to Mumbai)
Attachments: proforma_11087.pdf

Dear Sarvesh,

As we discussed Please find the attached Proforma Invoice for your reference.

Please release the payment at the earliest and P.O. ASAP.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

TAJ KHAN

Bright Roadlines

Safe & Fast Packing and Moving & Labour Work Services
8655563170 - 9140792819

www.brightroadlines.com
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BRIGHT ROADLINES

Safe & Fast Service

GSTIN : 27IHRPK1160H1Z1
UR No : UDYAM-MH-33-0193658

On Mon, Sep 9, 2024 at 6:04 PM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi,

As discussed kindly quote for 8ft Tempo Charges from Haryana(109, Sector 70A, Gurugram, Palra) to Mumbai Worli .

Regards

Sarvesh Patil



