7/8/24, 1:01 PM Mail - Cleyton Dcosta - Outlook

RE: fw:ups battery prise

Santosh Yadav <santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Mon 08-07-2024 11:17

To:Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>
Cc:Sarvesh Yelekar <sarvesh.yelekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Approved.

From: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>

Sent: Monday, July 8, 2024 11:16 AM

To: Santosh Yadav <santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Sarvesh Yelekar <sarvesh.yelekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: fw:ups battery prise

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

GENTLER REMINDER

@sSantosh Yadav Sir awaiting your approval for ordering ups battery.

Best Regards,

Cleyton D'costa

Purchase Department

Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.

Goa International Airport Dabolim,
Mobile: 9850476133 / 8097594061
Email: cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in

Website: www.travelfoodservices.com

www.k-hospitality.com

Office Address

Shop No 2,

Umiya Quatro D Block
Behind Highway Kitchen
Dabolim Goa-403801

From: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>

Sent: 05 July 2024 15:58

To: Santosh Yadav <santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: sarvesh.yelekar@travelfoodservices.com <sarvesh.yelekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fw: fw:ups battery prise

Dear Sir,

Attached quotation for ups battery as per requirement shared by Mr. Aziz.
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Cost will be 900 inclusive gst, (brand apc) 1 year warranty
Requirements will be for 6 nos

Kindly provide us approval for ordering.

Best Regards,

Cleyton D'costa

Purchase Department

Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.

Goa International Airport Dabolim,
Mobile: 9850476133 / 8097594061
Email: cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in

Website: www.travelfoodservices.com

www.k-hospitality.com

Office Address

Shop No 2,

Umiya Quatro D Block
Behind Highway Kitchen
Dabolim Goa-403801

From: Valuable Infosys <valuableinfosys@gmail.com>
Sent: 05 July 2024 15:40

To: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>
Subject: fw:ups battery prise

dear-sir

pls find attachments for battery qutation

Dealer & Stockiest For :

Rajesh Jain---

_sankeshwar infotech LLF.

16/B, ModY House, nd floor, Padmji Marg, Near Dreamland Cinema,
Mumbai - 400 004

Mo no.-9820990933/902229625/

mail --valuableinfosys@gmail.com
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