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Trupti Dalvi

From: Irfan Sayed
Sent: 25 June 2024 18:12
To: Trupti Dalvi
Cc: Divesh Tripathi; Stephen P; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp; Akshay Sharma; Shama Nair; Suraj Kumbhar
Subject: FW: TC Recommendation - : Domino's Non PO Items.
Attachments: Dominos Non PO Items-3.xlsx; DOMINOS Fire Fighting Non PO Items 2.xlsx; Non PO EXTRA ITEM-1.xlsx; INVOICE VSAS-IN-24-25-06 Dominos NonPO Items 24-June-2024.pdf

Dear Trupti 
 
Please upload the same on Safal for further PO processing for LKO-T3-Dominos NT items. 
 
Note :- One lac discount is given on the attached BOQ’s , check invoice for the same. 
 
Regards, 
Irfan 
 
 

From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 1:09 PM 
To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Saikat Pal <Saikat.Pal@adani.com>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; 
Binu Thankachan <Binu.Thankachan@adani.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sanjiv Dhawan <Sanjiv.Dhawan@adani.com> 
Subject: TC Recommendation - : Domino's Non PO Items. 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Irfan 
 
Please find attached revised Invoice against NT items pertaining to Dominos’s outlet at Lucknow submitted by VSAS group. 
 
Revised agreed price against all NT items listed in attached BOQ is Rs. 1,190,323.30 + taxes. 
 
Kindly proceed with the same to close the concern. 
 
Regards, 
Manish Mulchandani 
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From: Shubham Singh <vsasgroup@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2024 3:41 PM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> 
Subject: Re: Domino's Non PO Items. 
 
*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 

 
Dear Manish  
Attached Boq of the same with invoice attached below  
 
Thanks  
 
 
On Mon, 24 Jun 2024 at 02:44, Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> wrote: 

Dear Shubham 

  

Please share the BOQ with updated pricing for our further process. 

  

Regards, 

Manish Mulchandani 

  

From: Shubham Singh <vsasgroup@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2024 2:42 PM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> 
Subject: Domino's Non PO Items. 

  

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 
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Dear Manish  

As discussed on our call regarding Domino's Non PO Items we present our Final and No regret offer of Rupees 11,90,000 (Eleven Lakhs Ninety Thousand 
Only). 

Kindly proceed with the same and release the funds for the same. We will send an invoice of the same in the next mail. 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 

Shubham Singh  

VSAS Group 

  

 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is 
confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this 
e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views 
or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
 
WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any 
damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  
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