Trupti Dalvi

From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>

Sent: 21 December 2023 13:29

To: Stephen P

Cc: Shama Nair; Rupali Pol; Siddharth Purohit; Ajit Singh; Himanshu Singh; Suraj

Kumbbhar; Ajit Yadav; Trupti Dalvi; Nimisha Jadhav; Binu Balachandran; Jogeswar
Sahu; Sandeep Bhat; Santosh Sawant; Akshay Sharma; Ameet Koomar; Chirag Shah;
Awadhesh Kumar; Sonali Dhadve; Swapnil Sutar; Abdul Rehman; Santosh Tambe;
Stephen P; Lovejot Sekhon; Sarvesh Patil; Jatin Jain; Saikat Pal

Subject: RE: Subway - Ahmedabad T1 arrival

Attachments: Human Resources and Industrial Relations Requirements.pdf; GTC - Mid Value
Domestic On-site Works.pdf; Safety Requirements.pdf; Re: BOQ - Subway @
Ahmedabad Airport; Re: BOQ - Subway @ Ahmedabad Airport; STC - Non-aero
works @ AMD.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Stephen

Please ignore the previous mail and attachments and consider the one attached herewith.

Final Final Negotiated
Vendor Name Negotiated Amount with Project / Outlet
Amount Taxes
. Subway
M/s. MT Décor Rs.17,90,453 Rs.3,22,282 Rs.21,27,35 Ahmedabad T1

RA Bill & Payment Terms 50% Advance, 45% on completion and balance 5% after completion of DLP (6 months)
Other Terms & Conditions | As per STC and standard GTC (Attached).

Regards,
Manish Mulchandani

From: Manish Mulchandani

Sent: Thursday, December 21, 2023 1:16 PM

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Siddharth
Purohit <siddharth.purohit@semolinakitchens.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Himanshu
Singh <himanshu.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit
Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>;
Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>;
Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah
<Chirag.Shahl@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumarl@adani.com>; Sonali Dhadve
<Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>;
Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@travelfoodservices.com>;
Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@travelfoodservices.com>; Sarvesh Patil
<sarvesh.patil_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Saikat Pal
<Saikat.Pal@adani.com>

Subject: RE: Subway - Ahmedabad T1 arrival

Dear Stephen



With reference to subjected works, we hereby recommend below listed vendor for your further action.

Final Final Negotiated
Vendor Name Negotiated Amount with Project / Outlet
Amount Taxes
, Subway
M/s. MT Décor Rs.17,90,453 Rs.3,22,282 Rs.21,27,35 Ahmedabad T1

RA Bill & Payment Terms RA Bill cycle of 15 Days. Payment in 15 days from date of submission of bill.
Other Terms & Conditions | As per STC and standard GTC (Attached).

Vendor details as follows:
Contact person: Mr. Tarun Yadav
Mobile No.: +91 9560521111
Email ID: mtdecorllp@gmail.com

Attachments for reference:
1. Special Terms & Conditions
2. General Terms & Conditions
3. Safety Requirements
4. HRand IR Requirements

Kindly issue the Service Order to the vendor within 3 days and share a copy to us for confirmation.

Regards,

Manish Mulchandani
Contracts & Procurement

Cell No. | +91 8105870198
Adani Airport Holdings Limited

Office Address | 6" Floor | East, Commerce House 6, Corporate Road, Off S G Highway, Prahladnagar, Ahmedabad
380 051, Gujarat, India

e Growth _
a an| with Our Values: Courage | Trust | Commitment
Goodness

@ @ @ /AdaniCnline

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>
Sent: Tuesday, November 21, 2023 4:06 PM
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Siddharth
Purohit <siddharth.purohit@semolinakitchens.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Himanshu
Singh <himanshu.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit
Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>;
Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>;
Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah
<Chirag.Shahl@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumarl@adani.com>; Sonali Dhadve
<Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>;
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Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@travelfoodservices.com>;
Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@travelfoodservices.com>; Sarvesh Patil

<sarvesh.patil kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>

Subject: RE: Subway - Ahmedabad T1 arrival

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Dear Manish,

With reference to the below, please process further RFQ process for Subway - Ahmedabad T1 Arrival,

Regards
Stephen

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 21 November 2023 15:00

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Siddharth
Purohit <siddharth.purohit@semolinakitchens.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Himanshu
Singh <himanshu.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit
Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>;
Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>;
Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah
<Chirag.Shahl@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumarl@adani.com>; Sonali Dhadve
<Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>
Subject: Subway - Ahmedabad T1 arrival

Dear stephen,

Please find attached the link for Subway at Ahmedabad T1 Arrival, kindly take it forward with Asset TC for
vendor finalization and approval . The link contains the following .

Design Docket
BOQ-C& I, Electrical , Plumbing , HVAC , Make list , signage — Details in Mood board
Décor, furniture , Fabrication, Large equipment, Small equipment, hygiene, ( SOE ).
As confirmed by Subway M/S Stellar (Ashu Tripathi — 8527139030 & Ravinder -9999799567) is the SPOC and
will provide all the details as mentioned in pt.3
5. Mood Board and modular furniture and equipment’s drawings details .
6. Following are the Interior Turnkey vendors of SUBWAY as the details received from them .
a . Mr. Satish PATIL - 8080623999
b. Mr. Akram — 9920609228
¢. Mr. Rashid — 7500813986 / 8447451500 .

PwNPE

https://we.tl/t-bg950barUp - Kindly down load the link asap as it might expire as per their timeline .

Regards
Santosh TAMBE

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended
solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of
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this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies

of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the
author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the
presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.



