Ramendra Singh

From: anjaneya electricals <anjaneyaelectricals3@gmail.com>
Sent: 04 September 2024 13:48

To: Ramendra Singh

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma

Subject: Re: Freight Discount

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear sir,

Its confirmed.
Regards
Anand B
9538422816

On Mon, Sep 2, 2024 at 6:27 PM Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Anand,

As discussed over call, kindly gives 1000 freight discount as per attached PI

ANJANEYA ELECTRICALS
Item Qty Rate Amt Discount Rate-1 Amt 1
Compressor Embraco - SC1ISMLX.3 1 28,500 28500 28,500 28500
R404a Gas 10 1800 18000 1,800 18000
Freight 1 1000 1000 1000 0 0
Total 47500 46500




Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677



