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Abdul Rehman

From: Amma Enterprises <ammaenterpriseschennai@gmail.com>
Sent: 06 June 2024 11:38
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; Ramendra Singh
Subject: Re: Chennai Requirement
Attachments: Q61.pdf

Dear Sir, 
 
Greetings from Amma Enterprises! 
 
Sorry for the delay. 
 
Attached the Quote. 
 
 
Thanks & Regards. 
 
K. Prakash 
Amma  Enterprises 
No : 12B, Raghavan Nagar Main Road 
Near Amudham Nagar Arch 
Kodungaiyur,  
Chennai - 600 118. 
ammaenterpriseschennai@gmail.com. 
Phone : 99402 50078/84285 38078  
GST no: 33AZHPP6284F1Z5 
 
 
 
 
On Thu, 6 Jun 2024 at 10:36, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Attachment missing 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
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Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: Amma Enterprises <ammaenterpriseschennai@gmail.com>  
Sent: 05 June 2024 15:41 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> 
Subject: Re: Chennai Requirement 

  

Dear Sir,  

  

Greetings of the day! 

  

Please find attached hebrewith price Quote for Cibi weighing Scale and Maharani Heavy duty mixer. 
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Thanks & Regards. 

  

K. Prakash 



4

Amma  Enterprises 

No : 12B, Raghavan Nagar Main Road 

Near Amudham Nagar Arch 

Kodungaiyur,  

Chennai - 600 118. 

ammaenterpriseschennai@gmail.com. 

Phone : 99402 50078/84285 38078  

GST no: 33AZHPP6284F1Z5 

  

  

  

  

On Tue, 4 Jun 2024 at 17:09, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Prakash, 

  

As discussed with you on call, please share quotes for below mentioned equipment  

  

Weighing Scale tale top – 30 kg 2 qty  

EQUIRED HEAVY DUTY MIXER GRINDER  MAHARANI BRAND  MODEL NUMBER  JUMBO2000  WITH 3 JAR. Qt 1  
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Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  


