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Abdul Rehman

From: Jaspal c Singhh <jaspal.aalliance@gmail.com>
Sent: 08 April 2024 20:28
To: Abdul Rehman; Deepak Sawant
Cc: Manish Gakkhar
Subject: Re: Balance payment on readiness of material-PONO:TFSPL/PO/23-24/000341DT :29.03.24 DEL Budweiser Bar

Abdul Ji,  
 
 
Hyderabad  to Delhi Airport 20ft- Rs55750 
 
Thanks & Regards,  
 
Jaspal Singhh,  
 
Aalliance Tscs Pvt Ltd,  
L-5 KBM Compound, Military Rd, Marol, Andheri East 
Mumbai-400059 
M-9323456567. 
Web: www.aalliance.co.in 
Email:  info@aalliance.co.in 
 
"Assuring You The Best Of Services Always" 
 
     
 
On Mon, 8 Apr 2024, 14:22 Jaspal c Singhh, <jaspal.aalliance@gmail.com> wrote: 
Noted. 
I will revert on this shortly  

Thanks & Regards,  
 
Jaspal Singhh,  
 
Aalliance Tscs Pvt Ltd,  
L-5 KBM Compound, Military Rd, Marol, Andheri East 
Mumbai-400059 
M-9323456567. 
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Web: www.aalliance.co.in 
Email:  info@aalliance.co.in 
 
"Assuring You The Best Of Services Always" 
 
     
 
On Mon, 8 Apr 2024, 13:31 Abdul Rehman, <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Jaspal Ji,  

  

We will require 14 feet vehicle to pick up UV Hoods of Delhi Budweiser Bar. We need to pick this up between today or tomorrow hence request you to kindly let us know the availability of vehicle.  

  

Pickup Location - Revac systems, 16-939, Doolapally, Hyderabad-500043. 

  

Contact Person – Sai Charan 

Contact No - 81067 52289 

  

Delivery Address - New Terminal 1, Indira Gandhi International Airport, Domestic Departure Sha, Mehram Nagar, New Delhi, New Delhi, Delhi, 110037. 

  

Contact Person – Ajit 

Contact No - 9871014510 

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 



3

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: Revac Chefmate <revacsystems@gmail.com>  
Sent: 08 April 2024 13:20 
To: revac systems <info.revac23@gmail.com>; Sai Purchase <revacpurchase@gmail.com> 
Cc: procuresens@safalsoftcom.com; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: Balance payment on readiness of material-PONO:TFSPL/PO/23-24/000341DT :29.03.24 DEL Budweiser Bar 

  

sirs 

please co-ordinate with Mr Sai for pick up of material. 

sai can be reached on 81067 52289 

prbhu 

  

+91 92463 77652 

Ensuring Chefs don't get cooked!! 

www.revacsystems.com 

 

Member: ISHRAE, ASHRAE, FSAI, IIPE, IGBC & HOTREMAI 

  

  

 Save a tree. Don't print this e-mail unless it's really necessary. The future will thank you.  
You will save 5g of paper, 250ml of water and at least 35gm of C02! 
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On Mon, 8 Apr 2024 at 12:36, revac systems <info.revac23@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir,  

  

Material for the above PONo:- FSPL/PO/23-24/000341DT :29.03.24is in the final stage of production. 

  

We request  you to process the  payment as per the proforma enclosed showing the payable amount before dispatch  

  

Kindly do the needful and oblige.  

  

Thanks & Regards 

JAYASREE.M 

REVAC SYSTEMS 

Plot 83, Padma nagar 

Phase II, Chintal, 
Hyderabad-500054,  

India 

www.revacsystems.com 
info.revac23@gmail.com 
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