Pushpak Shewale

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Sent: 03 January 2025 13:20

To: Pushpak Shewale

Cc: Stephen P; Shadab Sukri

Subject: Re: Request for Estimate Review and Confirmation for Additional Buffet Counter T1-BLR-080 ph2
Dear Pushpak Sir,

Please review rate analysis of kota cladding

Kota stone 18-22 mm wall cladding (BLR-080 ph2 Boh area)

Final Amount I Sft

Per sqm

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.
Mobile : +91 9167593786 |1 9820089075

SR.NO ITEAM QTY|UNIT AMOUNT

1 Kota 1 | Sft 80.00

2 Stone wastage 10% | Sft 8.00

3 Stone transport 10% | Sft 8.00

4 Cement 1 | Sft 12.25

5 Toucha Sft 14.36

6 Ifal.)our charges including kota 1 | sfe 112.00

lifting

7 Debrish through from site 1 | Sft 10.00

8 Joint grounting 7.00
TOTAL PER SFT 251.61
Company profit 15% 37.74

overhead expences 5% 12.58

301.93
3,250.00

On Fri, Jan 3, 2025 at 12:42 PM Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale(@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Takbir Ji,

As discussed, please refer target prices. Kindly review and revert ASAP.




Regards,

Pushpak Shewale

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Sent: 31 December 2024 11:41

To: Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>

Subject: Fwd: Request for Estimate Review and Confirmation for Additional Buffet Counter T1-BLR-080 ph2

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.

Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820089075

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>

Date: Wed, Dec 25, 2024 at 5:00 PM

Subject: Re: Request for Estimate Review and Confirmation for Additional Buffet Counter T1-BLR-080 ph2

To: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com™>, Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>, Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Please go head

regards

Get Outlook for Android

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2024 8:50:23 PM
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>




Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: Request for Estimate Review and Confirmation for Additional Buffet Counter T1-BLR-080 ph2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ranjandas sir,

Gentle Reminder

On Sat, Dec 21, 2024, 11:54 AM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Shadab,

1) 1200x850x 950nmm=1no.

Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

Travel Food Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Saturday, 21 December 2024 10:39 am

To: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Request for Estimate Review and Confirmation for Additional Buffet Counter T1-BLR-080 ph2

Dear Takbir,

Please share unit rate

Regards



Shadab Sukri

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Sent: 20 December 2024 08:53 PM

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>
Subject: Request for Estimate Review and Confirmation for Additional Buffet Counter T1-BLR-080 ph2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ranjandas Sir,

As per the site in-charge's instructions regarding BLR-080 Phase 2, we require an estimate for the additional buffet counter. I kindly request you to review and confirm the estimate at your earliest convenience.
Once confirmed, we will arrange for all the necessary materials to proceed with the work.

ItemName UOM Rate Quantity Total

As per site instruction , additional Serving buffet counter structure
constructed out of 18 mm thk Fire rated plywood, At least 18 mm thk
approved Marble fixed to top with fascia in profile shown in drawing -
including Mirror polish. Marble to be tightly placed together and shall have
mitre joints on edges including moulding as approved by the Architect. All
joints to be filled with matching colour TIM-X or equivalent grout filler.
Ventilation space to be created with in the carcass as per drawing and all
internal non visible surfaces shall be in Black matt paint. Carcass to be
covered with 12mm thk DuPont Corian fluted panel on all exposed surfaces L.S 75750 1 75,750.00
including Led strip light provision,150 mm high skirting boxing to be made
in 18 mm thick ply covered with Italian marble. Ventilation space fascia to
be covered with 8 mm thick SS jali. SS jali in Bronze Satin finish, as

per approved design. Including all cut-outs for electrical points, induction
plates and temperature devices. (Basic cost of Marble at Rs. 450 sft ) (Basic
cost of fluted Corian at Rs. 1130 sft )Size 1200mm length x 750mm depth
x 950mm ht.

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,

Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.



Mobile : +91 9167593786 | 9820089075



