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Abdul Rehman

From: Manish  Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>
Sent: 05 January 2024 10:54
To: Irfan Sayed; Sandeep Bhat
Cc: Utkarsh Singh; Vaibhav Pandey; Raj Shekhar; Ashish Pandey; Ajay Surve; Abdul Rehman; Sanjiv Dhawan; Prakash Mistry; Khushbu Verma; Akshay Sharma; Saeed Khan; Shama Nair; 

Jatin Jain; Saikat Pal
Subject: TC Recommendation - Whitegloves - Lucknow Int. Airport - Equipment requirement
Attachments: Revsied Quotation 135- Electrolux Kitchen Equipment for Lucknow Airport.pdf; Re: RFQ - Lucknow Int. Airport - Equipment requirement

Dear Irfan/Sandeep 
 
Please find below our recommendation for your further process.  

        

Sl. NO. Project Item No. Product Description Size Make Model UOM 

98 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 18 Under Counter Dish Washing Machine 610 x 600 x 820 Electrolux 400153 No 
127 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-03 TABLE TOP HOT PLATE - GAS OPERATED  730 x 470 x 240Ht. ELECTROLUX  371038 No  

133 CIP Lounge, LKO LG-09 ELECTRIC OPERATED COMBI OVEN 6 
TRAY 850 x 842 x 754Ht. RATIONAL /6-1/1 GN PAN No  

136 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-11 SS 4 BURNER GAS RANGE WITH GAS 
OVEN BELOW  

800 x 730 x 
850+150SPL ELECTROLUX  

371003 COOKING RANGE 
700XP 4 BURNER GAS 
COMMERCIAL RANGE ON GAS 
OVEN. MODEL NUMBER: 
371002 

No  

156 Irish House, LKO BR - 01 Glass Washer 450 x 575 x 700 Electrolux NGWDPDD No 
                
      TOTAL         

 
Transportation cost extra. However, charges towards installation, commissioning and training as per the attached mail. For all other terms, refer attached quotation. 
 
Regards, 
Manish Mulchandani 
 

From: Whitegloves Inc <whiteglovesincinfo@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, January 5, 2024 9:11 AM 
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To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> 
Subject: Re: RFQ - Lucknow Int. Airport - Equipment requirement 
 
*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 
 
Dear Sir,  
 
PFA the correct offer. 
 
 
Warm Regards, 
 

 
Ritessh Kausshik 
+91-9643305236 
WhiteGloves Company Inc. 
#624-D,Zero Number Road, Ghitorni, 
New Delhi-110030, India 
Ccare-93 541 63 925 

 
 
 
On Thu, Jan 4, 2024 at 6:51 PM Whitegloves Inc <whiteglovesincinfo@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir,  
 
PFA the revised offer as discussed. 
 
 
 
Warm Regards, 
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Ritessh Kausshik 
+91-9643305236 
WhiteGloves Company Inc. 
#624-D,Zero Number Road, Ghitorni, 
New Delhi-110030, India 
Ccare-93 541 63 925 

 
 
 
On Thu, Jan 4, 2024 at 6:36 PM Whitegloves Inc <whiteglovesincinfo@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir,  
 
We acknowledge the receipt of your mail. 
 
 
Warm Regards, 
 

 
Ritessh Kausshik 
+91-9643305236 
WhiteGloves Company Inc. 
#624-D,Zero Number Road, Ghitorni, 
New Delhi-110030, India 
Ccare-93 541 63 925 
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On Thu, Jan 4, 2024 at 6:29 PM Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> wrote: 

Dear Ritesh 

  

As discussed, and agreed, if all machines will install in a same day, your charges towards installation, commissioning, training shall be Rs.10,000 as a lumpsum in total. 

  

If otherwise, charges mentioned in your proposal will prevail. 

  

Regards, 

Manish Mulchandani 

  

From: Whitegloves Inc <whiteglovesincinfo@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, January 4, 2024 5:39 PM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> 
Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Debobrata Das <debobrata.das@electroluxprofessional.com>; Yogender Rawat <yogender.rawat@electroluxprofessional.com>; 
Koushik Chakraborty <koushik.chakraborty@electroluxprofessional.com> 
Subject: Re: RFQ - Lucknow Int. Airport - Equipment requirement 

  

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 

  

Dear Sir,  
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As discussed, please find the attached revised offer.  

  

Under Counter Dishwashers have been changed to 1-Phase and Glass washer to Zanussi, 04 Burner Range with Gas Oven. Rest other items are the same. 

  

Please note that the Under Counter Dishwasher and Glass washer is in Mumbai Warehouse. It has to be picked up from there and rest other items can be picked up 
from our Delhi Warehouse. 

  

  

Warm Regards, 
 

 

Ritessh Kausshik 

+91-9643305236 

WhiteGloves Company Inc. 

#624-D,Zero Number Road, Ghitorni, 

New Delhi-110030, India 

Ccare-93 541 63 925 



6

 

  

  

On Tue, Jan 2, 2024 at 12:20 PM Whitegloves Inc <whiteglovesincinfo@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir,  

  

Greetings ! ! ! 

  

A very Happy New Year to you, your family and your team ! ! !  

  

Sorry for being late in submitting an offer due to year ending holidays in the factory. 

  

We would like to submit a consolidated offer for the required items. Kindly review and advise. 

  

 
 

Warm Regards, 
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Ritessh Kausshik 

+91-9643305236 

WhiteGloves Company Inc. 

#624-D,Zero Number Road, Ghitorni, 

New Delhi-110030, India 

Ccare-93 541 63 925 

 

  

  

On Fri, Dec 29, 2023 at 9:12 AM Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> wrote: 

#Subject changed as suitable 

  

Dear Ritesh 

  

IN continuation of trailing mail, awaiting your response. However, kindly share your prices for below items required for LKO outlets. 
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Sl. NO. Project Item No. Product Description Size Make Model UOM Qty Rate Amount 

98 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 18 Under Counter Dish 
Washing Machine 

610 x 600 x 
820 Electrolux 400153 No 1     

127 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-03 
TABLE TOP HOT 
PLATE - GAS 
OPERATED  

730 x 470 x 
240Ht. ELECTROLUX  371038 No  1    

136 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-11 
SS 4 BURNER GAS 
RANGE WITH GAS 
OVEN BELOW  

800 x 730 x 
850+150SPL ELECTROLUX  

371003 COOKING RANGE 700XP 4 
BURNER GAS COMMERCIAL RANGE ON 
GAS OVEN. MODEL NUMBER: 371002 

No  1    

156 Irish House BR - 01 Glass Washer 450 x 575 x 
700 Electrolux NGWDPDD No 1    

  

Kindly do the needful asap 

  

Regards, 

Manish Mulchandani 

  

  

From: Manish Mulchandani  
Sent: Saturday, December 9, 2023 2:03 PM 
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To: Whitegloves Inc <whiteglovesincinfo@gmail.com> 
Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Debobrata Das <debobrata.das@electroluxprofessional.com>; Yogender Rawat 
<yogender.rawat@electroluxprofessional.com>; Koushik Chakraborty <koushik.chakraborty@electroluxprofessional.com> 
Subject: RE: RFQ - Jaipur Int. Airport - CIP Lounge - Equipment requirement 

  

Dear Ritesh 

  

Dear Ritessh 

 
As discussed, the same product you quoted for Jaipur lounge is required for our Lucknow Lounge, 

  

However, keeping in view our future relationship, we request you to provide your no regret offer for Lucknow since we can’t proceed with Jaipur rates based on the equivalent brands 
offers, we received. 

  

Kindly revert with your offer for Lucknow latest by Monday. 

  

Regards, 

Manish Mulchandani 

  

  

From: Whitegloves Inc <whiteglovesincinfo@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, November 24, 2023 9:07 AM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> 
Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Karan Sabharwal <Karan.Sabharwal@adani.com>; Debobrata Das <debobrata.das@electroluxprofessional.com>; Yogender 
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Rawat <yogender.rawat@electroluxprofessional.com>; Koushik Chakraborty <koushik.chakraborty@electroluxprofessional.com> 
Subject: Re: RFQ - Jaipur Int. Airport - CIP Lounge - Equipment requirement 

  

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 

  

Dear Sir,  

  

Greetings ! ! ! 

  

Please find the attached offer for Electrolux 6G/N Digital Boilerless Combi Oven. 

  

 
 

Warm Regards, 
 

 

Ritessh Kausshik 

+91-9643305236 

WhiteGloves Company Inc. 
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#624-D,Zero Number Road, Ghitorni, 

New Delhi-110030, India 

Ccare-93 541 63 925 

 

  

  

On Thu, Nov 23, 2023 at 5:15 PM Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> wrote: 

Dear Ritesh 

  

Please share your price for below mentioned item which needs to be delivered to Jaipur International Airport. 

  

6TRAY GN PAN COMBI OVEN 

Electrolux - Skyline Pro Combi Boiler less 
Oven with digital control 

06x1/1GN, electric, programmable 

  

Combi oven with digital interface with 
guided selection- Boiler less steaming 
function to add and retain moisture. 
OptiFlow air distribution system to 
achieve maximum performance with 5 

No. 1 
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fan speed levels.    Sky Clean: Automatic 
and built-in self-cleaning system. 5 
automatic cycles (soft, medium, strong, 
extra strong, rinse-only). 

  
STAND FOR COMBI OVEN WITH 
1/1 GN PAN ARRANGEMENT 
BELOW 

 No. 1 

  

  

Regards, 

Manish Mulchandani  

Contracts & Procurement 

Cell No. | +91 8105870198 

Adani Airport Holdings Limited 

  

Office Address | 6th Floor | East, Commerce House 6, Corporate Road, Off S G Highway, Prahladnagar, Ahmedabad 380 051, Gujarat, India 

  

 



13

  

 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that 
is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or 
distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments 
from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
 
WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for 
any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  
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system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
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any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  
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WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for 
any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  
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damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  


