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Abdul Rehman

From: AceOneTech Support <serviceaceonetech1@gmail.com>
Sent: 28 March 2024 15:20
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar
Subject: Re: Una weighing scale
Attachments: quotation_2600.pdf

Respected Sir, 
Kindly find the attach. 
Thanks 
 
On Wed, Mar 27, 2024 at 6:15 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

HI, 

  

Request you to kindly share price of 30 kg, 50 kg & 100kg weighing scale. 

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
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ACE ONE TECH 
Unit no 427, Spaze Edge, Tower B 
Sector 47, Sohna Road Gurugram-122018 
Contact: 0124-4488295 
Mobile: 8595-670-162 
Web: www.aceonetech.in 


