
Outlook

RE: Office chair & table price

From Santosh Yadav <santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Thu 02-01-2025 16:51
To Ravikant Gunagi <ravikant.gunagi@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@travelfoodservices.com>

Approved.
 
From: Ravikant Gunagi <ravikant.gunagi@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 02 January 2025 16:24
To: Santosh Yadav <santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fw: Office chair & table price
 
Dear Sir,
 
As discussed, office chair and table sample picture attached .
 
Total cost = 36000 /-
Transportation charge = 1000 /- 
Quotation attached for your references 
 
Please approve....
 
 

Thanks and Regards,

Ravikant Gunagi

Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.

Goa International Airport,

Mobile: 8830186450

Website: www.travelfoodservices.com

www.k-hospitality.com

 

From: Ravikant Gunagi <ravikant.gunagi@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 24 December 2024 15:33
To: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Santosh Yadav <santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Office chair & table price
 
Dear Cleyton,
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As discussed, please find the attached office chair & table sample approved by Santosh sir
 
Kindly check price list 
 
Manager chair - 01 nos
Visitor chair - 04 nos
Manager Table - 01  nos   ( size 6 ft x 3 ft )
 
 

Thanks and Regards,

Ravikant Gunagi

Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.

Goa International Airport,

Mobile: 8830186450

Website: www.travelfoodservices.com

www.k-hospitality.com
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