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Re: Fw: Nutrition Book for printing spiral books- Goa-Dabolim

From Sujit Kesarkar <sujit.kesarkar@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Tue 08-10-2024 12:42
To Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>
Cc Santosh Yadav <santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Goa QA <goa.qa@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Cleyton Sir,

We can go ahead for the printing.

Thanks & Regards,
Sujit Kesarkar
Sr. Executive QHSE,
Travel Food Services pvt Ltd,
Goa International Airport,
 Goa-Dabolim, 403801

From: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>
Sent: Saturday, October 5, 2024 5:49:21 PM
To: Sujit Kesarkar <sujit.kesarkar@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Santosh Yadav <santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fw: Fw: Nutrition Book for printing spiral books- Goa-Dabolim
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sujit ji,

Attached proof copy and costing for spiral binding printing outlet wise kindly review the same and provide us approval for ordering.

Total value will be 835/-

Sr.
No Item Name Item Specification Size HSN Code GST

(%) Quantity

 
1 Cafeccino Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (8+2 page's ) A4 4820 18% -
             
2 CCD Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (3+2 Page's ) A4 4820 18% -
             
3 Curry kitchen Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (5+2 Page's) A4 4820 18% -
             
4 FLYING BITE Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (6+2 Page's) A4 4820 18% -
             
5 GTB Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (5+2 Page's) A4 4820 18% -
             
6 IDLI.com pdf Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (3+2 Page's) A4 4820 18% -
             
7 MAGGI Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (2+2 Page's) A4 4820 18% -
             
8 MUM STREAT Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (1+2 Page's) A4 4820 18% -
             
9 WRAP IT UP Printing 4 Col On 100 Gsm Paper With Sprial Binding (1+2 Page's) A4 4820 18% -

Best Regards,

Cleyton D'costa 
Purchase Department
Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd. 
Goa International Airport Dabolim, 
Mobile: 9850476133 / 8097594061
Email: cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in
Website: www.travelfoodservices.com 
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www.k-hospitality.com

Office Address
Shop No 2,
Umiya Quatro D Block
Behind Highway Kitchen
Dabolim Goa-403801

From: Pravin Gupta <nikiartsss@gmail.com>
Sent: 05 October 2024 17:38
To: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: Fw: Nutrition Book for printing spiral books- Goa-Dabolim
 
Please Check

On Sat, Oct 5, 2024 at 4:57 PM Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in> wrote:
Dear Pravin ji,

Cover page   (page 1) and outlet name  (page 2) not added in proof copy

Best Regards,

Cleyton D'costa 
Purchase Department
Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd. 
Goa International Airport Dabolim, 
Mobile: 9850476133 / 8097594061
Email: cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in
Website: www.travelfoodservices.com 
www.k-hospitality.com

Office Address
Shop No 2,
Umiya Quatro D Block
Behind Highway Kitchen
Dabolim Goa-403801

From: Pravin Gupta <nikiartsss@gmail.com>
Sent: 05 October 2024 13:05
To: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: Fw: Nutrition Book for printing spiral books- Goa-Dabolim
 
Dear Sir,
          Please Check The Attached File Of Quotation & Revert Back.

On Fri, Oct 4, 2024 at 11:41 AM Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in> wrote:
Dear Pravin ji,

As per below trailing mail kindly share the proof copy outlet wise and also the costing.

It should have spiral binding and cover page should be the first page then second page mention the outlet name and the details in the 3rd page with details

Best Regards,

Cleyton D'costa 
Purchase Department
Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd. 
Goa International Airport Dabolim, 
Mobile: 9850476133 / 8097594061
Email: cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in
Website: www.travelfoodservices.com 
www.k-hospitality.com

Office Address
Shop No 2,
Umiya Quatro D Block
Behind Highway Kitchen
Dabolim Goa-403801

From: Sujit Kesarkar <sujit.kesarkar@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 04 October 2024 11:28
To: Cleyton Dcosta <cleyton.dcosta@k-corp.in>; Goa Purchase <goa.purchase_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>
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Cc: Goa QA <goa.qa@travelfoodservices.com>; Ravi Kuril <ravi.kuril@travelfoodservices.com>; Milind Sawant <milind.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Yadav
<santosh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; sheetal.khot@gmrgroup.in <sheetal.khot@gmrgroup.in>
Subject: Nutrition Book for printing spiral books- Goa-Dabolim
 
Dear Cleyton,

Please find the attached Nutritional value books to keep in printed format at the outlets.

1. Cover Page will be same for all file.
2. Excel file with outlet names sheets- Need 1 copy for each sheet in colour.

Required spiral binding books for all sheets- Numbers- 1 Each

Thanks & Regards,
Sujit Kesarkar
Sr. Executive QHSE
Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.
Goa International Airport, Dabolim
South Goa- 403801
Contact- 9922710792
Email- sujit.kesarkar@travelfoodservices.com

--
Thanks & Regards
Niki Arts
Pravin Gupta
9028911211 / 9270491241

--
Thanks & Regards
Niki Arts
Pravin Gupta
9028911211 / 9270491241
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