Sarvesh Patil

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 06 September 2023 13:20

To: Lovejot Sekhon; Binu Balachandran; Jogeswar Sahu; Stephen P; Sarvesh Patil; Sandeep Bhat;
Kamal Saraf; Jagat.Patel@adani.com

Cc: Shama Nair; Ajit Yadav; Rupali Pol; Suraj Kumbhar; Trupti Dalvi; Nimisha Jadhav; Prakash

Mistry; Khushbu Verma; Nalin Jaswal; Jatin Jain; Dhruv Thakkar; Taha Abdullah Masvi; Ameet
Koomar; Akshay Sharma; Nilesh Patil; Noel Dias; Gaurav Dewan

Subject: FW: Office Admin Requirement Comparison

Attachments: Adani Capex RCSL Quotation.pdf; CS.xlsx

Dear Team Purchase,

Please find the approval received from Asset TC for Ahmedabad store equipment’s against the vendor M/S Riddhi corporate services, Kindly get
the vendor registration done and release the PO and the advances for the same .Kindly take it on top priority , we are starting the business in
Ahmedabad by 20/9/23 with the opening of Roastea followed by Shawarma cart and Tacos and Nachos cart for which this temporary store has to be
setup.

Regards
Santosh TAMBE

From: Jagat Patel <Jagat.Patel@adani.com>

Sent: 06 September 2023 10:36

To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Nalin Jaswal <Nalin.Jaswal@adani.com>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Dhruv
Thakkar <Dhruv.Thakkar@adani.com>; Taha Abdullah Masvi <taha.masvi@adani.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol
<rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>;
Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P
<stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>;
Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Office Admin Requirement Comparison

You don't often get email from jagat.patel@adani.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the
content is safe.

Dear Santosh,

We have provided you with comparative statement and recommendations. You can take process accordingly.
PFA CS and final quotation of L1 vendor for your reference.

With Regards,

Jagat Patel

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, September 4, 2023 5:44 PM

To: Jagat Patel <Jagat.Patel@adani.com>; Nalin Jaswal <Nalin.Jaswal@adani.com>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Dhruv Thakkar
<Dhruv.Thakkar@adani.com>; Taha Abdullah Masvi <taha.masvi@adani.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; akshay.sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol
<rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>;
Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P
<stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>;
Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: Office Admin Requirement Comparison

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*



Dear Jagat,

Here Riddhi seems to be L1 vendor, do you refer the order to be released to him , kindly confirm in the below format as designed by Mr. Ameet
Koomar for all the vendor allocation Team TC kindly follow this process

Final Negotiated Final Negotiated LENERS

Vendor Name

Amount Amount with Taxes
The Comparative quote
Portable Cabin was verified and Found

DNMR Electrical o : . DNMR is the L1 same
and Civil Works 64,900 18% 76,582 electrical earthing has been approved by

work at T2 Cityside the Evaluator kindly

proceed

Regards
Santosh TAMBE

From: Jagat Patel <Jagat.Patel@adani.com>

Sent: 04 September 2023 16:00

To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Nalin Jaswal <Nalin.Jaswal@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>
Subject: RE: Office Admin Requirement Comparison

You don't often get email from jagat.patel@adani.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the
content is safe.

Dear Santosh,

We were able to negotiate and reduce price of Sr No 3 “Plastic case” further. Same has been updated in the attached CS sheet.
Final Quotation from M/s Riddhi Corporate Services Ltd has been attached with this mail for your reference.

With Regards,

Jagat Patel

From: Jagat Patel

Sent: Monday, September 4, 2023 1:51 PM

To: santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Nalin Jaswal Nalin.Jaswal@adani.com; akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com
Subject: Office Admin Requirement Comparison

Dear Santosh,

Pls find the attached comparison of the quotes received from the Vendors . Please process accordingly.Red Highlighted prices are not considered as
same are not matching with technical requirements.

M/s Riddhi Corporate Services Ltd is L1.
Contact Details are mentioned below
Email ID : jay.patel@riddhicorp.in
Contact no: 7990799425

Rest of items which are not mentioned CS to be procured through ARC list
With Regards,
Jagat Patel

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and
may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the
sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are
solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses.
Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and
may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
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