RE: Require Approval.

Arindam Chakraborty <arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in>
Thu 4/4/2024 12:58 PM

To:Hemant Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in>

Cc:Preetam Gupta <preetam.gupta@cateringcollective.in>;Vijay Chauhan <vijay.chauhan@cateringcollective.in>;Rupesh Ghagh
<chef.odc@cateringcollective.in>;Central Kitchen <ck@cateringcollective.in>;Stores Blue Sea <stores@cateringcollective.in>;Kamlesh Sawant
<kamlesh.sawant@kapcocatering.com>;Pravin Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>;Mahendra Shinde <mahendra.shinde@k-corp.in>;Ashay
Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>

Arindam Chakraborty oo
o Chief Operating Officer b
Caterlng @ +919152215366
Collective arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in
B www.cateringcollective.in
1, Rashid Mansion, Dr Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai - 400018
Dear Sir,

We are waiting for your approval.

Please Approve.

R ga e HEMANT KAJUWALKAR
< < = Junior Executive - Supply Chain & Procurement
TS 6 +918879 773 36|

K A D C O £ mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in

A aleTe e D RING @ [, Rashid Mansion, Dr Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai - 400018

From: Hemant Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase @k-corp.in>

Sent: Wednesday, April 3, 2024 2:58 PM

To: Arindam Chakraborty <arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in>

Cc: Preetam Gupta <preetam.gupta@cateringcollective.in>; Vijay Chauhan <vijay.chauhan@cateringcollective.in>; Rupesh Ghagh
<chef.odc@cateringcollective.in>; Central Kitchen <ck@cateringcollective.in>; Stores Blue Sea <stores@cateringcollective.in>; Kamlesh
Sawant <kamlesh.sawant@kapcocatering.com>; Pravin Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>; Mahendra Shinde
<mahendra.shinde@k-corp.in>; Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>

Subject: Require Approval.

Dear Sir,

As per the trial mail, Please find the attached file of Gurukurpa PI copy.
The total cost of rental charges for 13 days is 114833 + GST.

Require your Approval for making of PO.

Please Approve.
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K A D C O &8 mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in

EAN T & AT ERING @ |, Rashid Mansion, Dr Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai - 400018

From: Hemant Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase @k-corp.in>

Sent: Tuesday, April 2, 2024 1:34 PM

To: Gurukrupa Transport <gurukrupa.transport@gmail.com>; Gurukrupa Accounts <accounts@gurukrupabiz.in>; Nilesh Pansare
<nilesh.pansare@gurukrupabiz.in>

Cc: Preetam Gupta <preetam.gupta@cateringcollective.in>; Vijay Chauhan <vijay.chauhan@cateringcollective.in>; Rupesh Ghagh
<chef.odc@cateringcollective.in>; Central Kitchen <ck@cateringcollective.in>; Stores Blue Sea <stores@cateringcollective.in>; Kamlesh
Sawant <kamlesh.sawant@kapcocatering.com>; Pravin Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>; Mahendra Shinde
<mahendra.shinde @k-corp.in>; Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>; Arindam Chakraborty
<arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in>

Subject: Refrigerator van Requirement from 2nd April 2024 to 14 April 2024 at Kurla Central Kitchen.

Dear Nilesh Sir,
Greetings from Kapco Banquets & Catering Pvt. Ltd.....!!!!

This is regarding our discussion of the requirement for a 14 Ft Refrigerated Van Standby at Kurla
Central Kitchen.

You are hereby requested to deploy Van from 2nd April 2024 to 14th April 2024.

You are hereby requested to connect with Mr. Balkrishna from Kurla Central Kitchen and do the
needful.

Please share the Proforma Invoice for making of PO.

HEMANT KAJUWALKAR

Junior Executive - Supply Chain & Procurement
6 +91 8879773 361
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K A D C O &8 mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in

EANOLETE 1 BATERING @ |, Rashid Mansion, Dr Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai - 400018
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