Re: TATA IPL 2024 - Kitchen Usage at Wankhede Stadium

Arindam Chakraborty <arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in>

Wed 4/10/2024 7:46 PM

To:Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>;Hemant Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in>

Cc:Mahendra Shinde <mahendra.shinde@k-corp.in>;Rohit Kini <rohit.kini@cateringcollective.in>;Pallavi Shinde <pallavi.shinde@blueseacatering.com>;Jay Pitroda
<jay.pitroda@cateringcollective.in>;Pravin Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>;Deepa Sarode <deepa.sarode@kapcocatering.com>;Shailendra Jain
<shailendrajain@kapcocatering.com>

From: Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2024 7:32:11 PM

To: Hemant Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in>; Arindam Chakraborty <arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in>

Cc: Mahendra Shinde <mahendra.shinde@k-corp.in>; Rohit Kini <rohit.kini@cateringcollective.in>; Pallavi Shinde <pallavi.shinde@blueseacatering.com>; Jay Pitroda
<jay.pitroda@cateringcollective.in>; Pravin Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>; Deepa Sarode <deepa.sarode@kapcocatering.com>; Shailendra Jain
<shailendra.jain@kapcocatering.com>

Subject: Re: TATA IPL 2024 - Kitchen Usage at Wankhede Stadium

Dear Arindam

This is for usage of piped gas at the stadium. The cost is same as last year and we have to pay them every year

Thank you

Regards
Ashay Desai

From: Hemant Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in>

Date: Wednesday, 10 April 2024 at 4:32 PM

To: Arindam Chakraborty <arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in>

Cc: Mahendra Shinde <mahendra.shinde@k-corp.in>, Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>, Rohit Kini
<rohit.kini@cateringcollective.in>, Pallavi Shinde <pallavi.shinde@blueseacatering.com>, Jay Pitroda <jay.pitroda@cateringcollective.in>,
Pravin Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>, Deepa Sarode <deepa.sarode@kapcocatering.com>, Shailendra Jain
<shailendra.jain@kapcocatering.com>

Subject: Re: TATA IPL 2024 - Kitchen Usage at Wankhede Stadium

Dear Sir,
As per the trail mail, need your approval for making of PO.

Please Approve.

R EE 3 HEMANT KAJUWALKAR
< < 4 Junior Executive - Supply Chain & Procurement
O § € +91 8879773 361

K A D C o ¢ mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in

(U 5k BATERING 1, Rashid Mansion, Dr Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai - 400018

From: Jay Pitroda <jay.pitroda@cateringcollective.in>

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2024 4:26 PM

To: Hemant Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in>; Pravin Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>; Deepa Sarode <deepa.sarode@kapcocatering.com>;
Shailendra Jain <shailendra.jain@kapcocatering.com>

Cc: Mahendra Shinde <mahendra.shinde@k-corp.in>; Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>; Rohit Kini <rohit.kini@cateringcollective.in>; Pallavi Shinde
<pallavi.shinde@blueseacatering.com>

Subject: Fw: TATA IPL 2024 - Kitchen Usage at Wankhede Stadium

Dear Hemant,

Please find attached invoice for Karishma Catering services towards kitchen rentals for IPL season 2024 at Wankhede stadium.

Kindly make the PO and submit to finance for processing the payment.

Regards,



Catering
Collective

From: All Seasons Banquets "MCA - The Lounge" <allseasonsbanquetsmca@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, April 5, 2024 3:18 PM

To: Jay Pitroda <jay.pitroda@cateringcollective.in>

Subject: Re: TATA IPL 2024 - Kitchen Usage at Wankhede Stadium

Dear Jay,

Please find enclosed the final invoice for your kind perusal.

Manmeet Kaur Parekh
Head - Sales & Marketing

91
.9930069395

Landline :

91
22

22041091/92

A division of Karishma Catering Services Pvt. Ltd.
The MCA Lounge,
Wankhede Stadium,
D-Road, Marine Drive, Churchgate, Mumbai - 400020
Follow us @ Instagram:
allseasonsbanquets
http://allseasonsbanquets.com/

jay.pitroda@cateringcollective.in

Dear Manmeet,

Namashkar !!

Jay Pitroda

Manager - Operations

@ +917045911767
jay.pitroda@cateringcollective

www.cateringcollective.in
@ 1, Rashid Mansion, Dr. Annie Be

We shall make the said payments per match of 25000/- plus tax ( Gas and Kitchen rentals ) after every 2 matches.

Thank you,

Regards,


http://allseasonsbanquets.com/
mailto:jay.pitroda@cateringcollective.in

Jay Pitroda

Manager - Operations

+91 7045911 767
jay.pitroda@cateringcollectiv

www.cateringcollective.in
@ 1, Rashid Mansion, Dr. Annie B

Catering
Collective

From: All Seasons Banquets "MCA - The Lounge" <allseasonsbanquetsmca@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 26, 2024 6:45 PM

To: Rohit Kini <rohit.kini@cateringcollective.in>

Cc: Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>; Jay Pitroda <jay.pitroda@cateringcollective.in>
Subject: TATA IPL 2024 - Kitchen Usage at Wankhede Stadium

Dear Rohit,

Greetings of the day!!

It was a pleasure meeting you and your team in regards to the Kitchen usage for the upcoming season of TATA IPL 2024 (season 17) for Mumbai
Indians at Wankhede Stadium.

Kitchen will be assigned to Franchise Catering Vendor, 10 hours prior to the match i.e., for the 3:30 pm match we will hand over the kitchen a day prior
and for a 7:30 pm match, kitchen will be handed over the same day in the morning, due to our own catering commitments.

Franchise Catering Vendor, will hand over the kitchen back to us within 4 hours, post deep-cleaning once the match is over, as we have catering
commitments that requisite to start their preparation immediately.

Kitchen has to be fully cleaned and with no utensils or station wagon being held in reserve.

The Franchise Catering Vendor will indemnify M/s. Karishma Catering Services Pvt Ltd against accidents/fire etc. during the event and will be liable to
compensate for any loss/damage/breakdown of equipment’s civil structure etc.

The Compensation amount payable for the usage of kitchen (main kitchen & MCA Lounge kitchen) per match will be Rs. 25,000 plus GST per match.

Total amount of Rs. 1,75,000 + GST (7 matches x 25,000) be credited to us prior to the event, attached is the PO for your kind
perusal.

Kindly confirm the same and release the payment before the match day only for smooth functioning.

Manmeet Kaur Parekh
Head - Sales & Marketing

91
-9930069395

Landline :
91
22


mailto:allseasonsbanquetsmca@gmail.com
mailto:rohit.kini@cateringcollective.in
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22041091/92

A division of Karishma Catering Services Pvt. Ltd.
The MCA Lounge,
Wankhede Stadium,
D-Road, Marine Drive, Churchgate, Mumbai - 400020
Follow us @ Instagram:
allseasonsbanquets
http://allseasonsbanquets.com/
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