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Ramendra Singh

From: Aakash International Equipment Services <aakash.service.mumbai@gmail.com>
Sent: 20 December 2024 11:13
To: Ramendra Singh
Cc: Saurav Pillai; shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in
Subject: Re: Give us 10% discount

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 

 

Dear Ramendra ji, 
Good Morning!!! 

As discussed over the phone, we are pleased to offer you a 5% discount on basic rate. To proceed further, we 
kindly request you to make 100% advance payment at your earliest convenience so that we can proceed further. 

Best Regards  
Kailash Prajapati  

 
On Fri, 20 Dec, 2024, 10:36 Ramendra Singh, <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote: 

Dear Kailash, 

  

Kindly gives 10% discount on per unit rate & Installation charges, 

Kindly confirm the same 

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Ramendra Singh 

9999118677 

  

  


