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Samarth Rastogi Akshit Sogani
RE: Pro-Forma Invoice for TFS IPO Video
Approved

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 28, 2024 10:12 AM

To: Samarth Rastogi <samarth.rastogi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fw: Pro-Forma Invoice for TFS IPO Video

Hi Samarth,
Need single vendor approval for Adko for IPO video.

Thank you
Akshit Sogani

Sent from Outlook for Android

From: Accounts AdKo <accounts@adko.in>
Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 6:23:03 PM

To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Ce: RISHI UDAPURKAR <rishi@adko.in>
Subject: Pro-Forma Invoice for TFS IPO Video

Hi Akshit,

Please find the Pro-Forma Invoice for TFS IPO Video attached to this mail, we would request you to kindly raise a PO for the same.




