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RE: Balaram Mullick Store SAV

From Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Thu 11/28/2024 4:47 PM
To Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>; Shruti Shroff <shruti.shroff@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>

ok
 

 
From: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 28 November 2024 16:40
To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>; Shruti Shroff <shruti.shroff@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fw: Balaram Mullick Store SAV
 
Dear Sudipto sir , 
 
This is the quote shared for the balaram Mullick back side execution . Kindly suggest if we can do it as cash purchase or as per direct invoice submission . 
 
Regards 
Rishav 
 
Get Outlook for iOS

From: THE WORK STATION INC <workstationevents@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 28, 2024 4:27:13 PM
To: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Balaram Mullick Store SAV
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.
 
Respected Sir,
Please check the attached quotation as per your requirement.
 
 
 
--
Thanks & Regards
 
The Work Station Inc.
Events & Media Studio.
Office no : 033-6555-5698/85
Email : workstationevents@gmail.com
Corporate Office - 130 Basanta Lal Saha Road, Kolkata 700-053 
New Alipur (Near South City Garden)
Branch Office : 5, Russa Road South 2nd Lane, Kolkata - 700-033 . 
 (Near M R Bangur Hospital)
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