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Samarth Rastogi Akshit Sogani

RE: Purchase invoice

Approved

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 26, 2024 11:57 AM

To: Samarth Rastogi <samarth.rastogi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Purchase invoice

Hi Samarth Sir,
Need single vendor approval for IPO Video editing & Translation, confirmed with Karan Kapur.

Thank you
Akshit Sogani

From: Priya Raj <priyaraj1627 @gmail.com>
Sent: 25 November 2024 15:58

To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Purchase invoice

Dear sir

Attached tax invoice against work done

Thanks




