
From: Nikhil Bhushan
To: Aniket Sawant; Asad Shamsi
Cc: Jagraj Singh Randhawa
Subject: RE: additional table license
Date: 22 December 2023 14:08:14

Approved
 
Regards,
 
Nikhil
+91 9820171661
 

From: Aniket Sawant <aniket.sawant@travelfoodservices.com> 
Sent: 22 December 2023 12:06
To: Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nikhil Bhushan
<nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Jagraj Singh Randhawa <jagrajsingh.randhawa@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: additional table license
 
Dear Asad,
 
We have one new table requirement in NAV for developments and we already consumed all
exiting tables available in our license, therefore kindly make a new PR for additional
table(license) purchase from alle tech.
 
@Nikhil sir – Please approve.
 
 
 
Thanks & Regards,
Aniket Sawant
Manager IT
Mobile : 7506040600
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