Trupti Dalvi

From: Irfan Sayed

Sent: 23 June 2024 17:14

To: Trupti Dalvi

Cc: Divesh Tripathi; Stephen P; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp
Subject: RE: FW: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder
Attachments: Lucknow SUBWAY sheet-01, Date 18-06-2024.xIsx
Importance: High

Dear Trupti

Please raise PR as per attached sheet for LKO-T3-Subway..

Regards,
Irfan

From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2024 12:44 AM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ak Projects akprojectsacnt@gmail.com; Divesh Tripathi divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com; Stephen P <stephen.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi
<trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Irfan ji

As discussed please see the details below
1. Motorized valve Motorized valve fitted in return chw line to control room temperature and chw water.
2. Gss duct and grill Gss Duct - galvanized sheet steel and Aluminum ac Grill

3. Thirmowell & fitting for btu Meter Thermowell - Thermowall is connected to the main chw line in which the temperature meter of Btu meter is installed.
4 Machine transport  Factory is in Chennai



For any clarifications feel free to contact me

Thanks & Regards
Ak Projects

On Wed, 19 Jun, 2024, 15:32 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Akram

Please find revert from Stephen as he needs furthermore details as per comments in attached sheet.

Regards,

Irfan

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Sent: Wednesday, June 19, 2024 9:34 AM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.




From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: 15 June 2024 13:09

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Alka Singh <alkas8609 @gmail.com>; Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh
Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Akshay
Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

Dear Irfan ji

Please find the attached Corrected Extra Work Exel files

Revert or Call Back for Any Clarification

Thanks & Regards



Akram

On Tue, 11 Jun, 2024, 14:54 A .k Projects, <akproject79@gmail.com> wrote:

DEAR SIR

PLEASE FIND THE ATTACHED ADDITIONAL BILL FOR LKO T-3 SUBWAY

REVERT OR CALL BACK FOR ANY CLARIFICATION

THANKS & REGARDS

AK PROJECTS

On Tue, 11 Jun 2024 at 08:52, Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Akram



Will discuss today on the same around 11:30 am.

Regards,

Irfan

From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, June 10, 2024 11:41 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Alka Singh <alkas8609 @gmail.com>; Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh
Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>;
Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Irfan

What's kind of details required. Please let me know and All work has under your supervision



Please recieved my call

I am trying since last month

Thanks & Regards

Ak Projects

On Mon, 10 Jun, 2024, 22:37 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Dhananjay

Need detailed specifications to process further as per mail from Stephen which is pending at your end.

Kindly share the same for further closure on the same.

Regards,

Irfan



From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, June 10, 2024 3:45 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Alka Singh <alkas8609 @gmail.com>; Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh
Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-
corp.in>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Reminder 3

On Mon, 3 Jun, 2024, 17:53 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Team

Stephen required detailed specifications for further closure on the same instead of one line item.

Regards,

Irfan



From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, June 3, 2024 5:43 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Alka Singh <alkas8609 @gmail.com>; Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh
Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-
corp.in>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Irfan ji

Please find the attached Extra work PIL.

As we have submitted in Feb also

Revert or call back for any clarification

Thanks & Regards



A K PROJECTS

On Mon, 3 Jun, 2024, 17:27 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Akram

Please share the details as asked from Stephen end for further closure on the same.

Could you please share specification/details of the Items in BOQ.

Regards,

Irfan

From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, June 3, 2024 1:01 PM

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Alka Singh <alkas8609@gmail.com>; Divesh
Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.




Reminder 2

On Thu, 30 May, 2024, 15:51 Stephen P, <stephen.p@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Irfan,

Could you please intervene

From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: 30 May 2024 15:43

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Alka Singh <alkas8609@gmail.com>; Divesh
Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

Any updates ?

On Tue, 28 May, 2024, 14:14 Stephen P, <stephen.p@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Irfan,

Could you please confirm the item specification along with the measurements to proceed further.
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Regards

Stephen

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Sent: 27 May 2024 15:55

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Cc: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Alka Singh <alkas8609 @gmail.com>; A.k Projects <akproject79 @gmail.com>; Divesh Tripathi
<divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: RE: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

Dear Irfan,

Could you please share specification/details of the Items in BOQ.

With the data that is available in system we are unable to derive the costing nor would be able to negotiate with vendor

The data available in SAFAL is as below

P/F OF FIRE DOOR

P/F OF FIRE RATED GYPSOM
P/F OF ELECTRIC METER

P/F OF FCU) BTU METER
FCU
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FCU MOTER PIPE VALVE ETC
TESTING OF FS AND HVAC

Regards

Stephen

From: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 27 May 2024 15:19

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Cc: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Alka Singh <alkas8609 @gmail.com>; A.k Projects <akproject79 @gmail.com>; Divesh Tripathi
<divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: RE: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway | Reminder

Dear Stephen

Please confirm on PO for further processing.

Regards,

Irfan
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From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, May 27, 2024 10:16 AM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Alka Singh <alkas8609 @gmail.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Divesh
Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Still waiting.

On Thu, 23 May, 2024, 08:44 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

+++ Looping Stephen

Dear Stephen

Please update on the status of the same.

Regards,

Irfan
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From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2024 2:23 PM

To: A.k Projects <akproject79 @gmail.com>; Alka Singh <alkas8609 @gmail.com>

Cc: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Akshay
Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: RE: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan

Kindly update on trailing email.

Regards,

Manish Mulchandani

From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2024 2:20 PM

To: Alka Singh <alkas8609@gmail.com>

Cc: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Manish
Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: FW: R1 Lko Airport Subway
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*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

(@Irfan Sayed please close bills.
@Alka Singh

On Mon, 26 Feb, 2024, 10:43 Alka Singh, <alkas8609@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Irfan G,

Pls find attached GST Invoice with MB

Thanks & Regards

AK Project's

On Mon, Feb 26, 2024, 06:31 Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Dhananjay
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Please raise invoice for further processing. Also attached hard copy of signed JMR.

Regards,

Irfan

From: Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: Sunday, February 25, 2024 5:03 PM

To: Alka Singh <alkas8609@gmail.com>

Cec: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>; Manish
Mulchandani <manish.mulchandani@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: R1 Lko Airport Subway

Hello Irfan Sir,

I haved Checked all the bills everything is ok from my end you can proceed with further process and for JMC sheet please see the trail mail.

Thank you,

Divesh Tripathi.
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From: Alka Singh <alkas8609@gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, February 25, 2024 10:58 AM

To: Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>

Cec: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; A .k Projects <Akproject79@gmail.com>; Manish
Mulchandani <manish.mulchandani@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: R1 Lko Airport Subway

You con't often get email from alkas8609@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Divesh Ji,

PIs find attached final R1 without any extra work , Request you to Process the payment on priority .will send you soon extra work sheet also.

Revert or call back for any clarifications.

Thanks & Regards

AK Project's

On Sat, Feb 24, 2024, 14:30 A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Divesh
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Please find the attached Required Documents

Revert Or call back for any clarification

Thanks & Regards

Ak Projects

On Wed, 21 Feb, 2024, 15:49 Divesh Tripathi, <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Hello A.K.Projects,

Send all the rates which approved by the Mr. Irfan for miscellaneous work.
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Thanks,

Divesh Tripathi

From: A .k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 21, 2024 3:43 PM

To: Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>

Cec: Alka Singh <alkas8609@gmail.com>; Manish Mulchandani <manish.mulchandani@adani.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Irfan
Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: R1 Lko Airport Subway

You clon't often get email from akproject79@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Divesh

All rate have approved

Please check with @Irfan Sayed ji
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Thanks & Regards

Ak Projects

On Wed, 21 Feb, 2024, 15:18 Divesh Tripathi, <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Hello Alka,

I have Checked all the MB Sheet everything is ok from my end but there is a miscellaneous work in the sheet which rates are not approved
so first we have to approve the rates and after that we can proceed with the miscellaneous work.
So, I request you that first you have to raise the RA 1 according to the JMR Sheet which rates are already approved so we can proceed with the

further process.

Thanks,

Divesh Tripathi.

From: Alka Singh <alkas8609@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, February 17, 2024 6:38 PM

To: Manish Mulchandani <manish.mulchandani@adani.com>; Haresh Tapre <htapre@subway.in>; Irfan Sayed
<irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; A.k Projects <Akproject79@gmail.com>;
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Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>
Subject: Fwd: R1 Lko Airport Subway

You con't often get email from alkas8609@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Devesh G,

Pls find enclosed R1

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: A.k Projects <akproject79@gmail.com>

Date: Sat, Feb 17, 2024, 18:12

Subject: R1 Lko Airport Subway

To: Manish Mulchandani <manish.mulchandani@adani.com>

Cc: <alkas8609@gmail.com>, Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>, Haresh Tapre
<htapre(@subway.in>

Hi Manish ji

Please find the attached R1 for Lko Airport Subway site. Request you to Process the payment on priority .
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Revert or call back for any clarifications.

Thanks & Regards

Ak Projects

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information
that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or
distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments
from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.
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