Trupti Dalvi

From: Irfan Sayed

Sent: 21 February 2024 12:36

To: Trupti Dalvi

Cc: Suraj Kumbhar; Sandeep Bhat; Abdul Rehman; Swapnil Sutar; Stephen P; Lovejot Sekhon; Binu Balachandran; Divesh Tripathi; Prakash Mistry; Khushbu Verma; Akshay Sharma; Shama
Nair

Subject: FW: TC Recommendation - Supply of Fabricated Kitchen Equipment (Lucknow Street) at Lucknow Int. Airport - Terminal-3 - Safal upload

Attachments: REV 24-25-79 ADANI GROUP QUO 19-02-2024.pdf

Dear Trupti

As per trial mail and attachment upload the same on Safal and confirm once done to proceed further.

Regards,
Irfan

From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 21, 2024 11:52 AM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sanjiv Dhawan <Sanjiv.Dhawan@adani.com>; Raj Shekhar
<Raj.Shekhar@adani.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>;
Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>

Subject: TC Recommendation - Supply of Fabricated Kitchen Equipment (Lucknow Street) at Lucknow Int. Airport - Terminal-3

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan/Sandeep

Please find below our recommendation towards fabricated Kitchen equipment pertaining to Lucknow Street.

Sl. No. Project Location | Amount w/o Tax | GST @ 18% | Amount with Tax Vendor
1 Lucknow Street | LKO Rs.10,70,669 Rs.1,92,720 | Rs.12,63,389 Goyal Kitchen Equipment
TOTAL Rs.10,70,669 Rs.1,92,720 | Rs.12,63,389

Attached quotation for your reference. All terms and conditions as per previous orders.



Regards,
Manish Mulchandani

From: ANKUR AGARWAL <anupamat1985@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, February 19, 2024 6:21 PM

To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>
Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ - Supply of Fabricated Kitchen Equipment (Lucknow Street) at Lucknow Int. Airport -

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

DEAR SIR

KINDLY CHECKED THE ATTACHED FILE OF REVISED QUOTATION.
THANKS & REGARDS

VISHNU KANT

B.D.M

On Thu, Feb 1, 2024 at 1:14 PM Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Ma’am

Terminal-3

GOYAL KITCHEN EQUIPMENTS

Contact Address.:
22 Gautam Buddha Marg
Lucknow : 226001
M. +91-9415024370, 9919191914
Tele : 0522-4104659
Customer Care- +917860021931
Email: anupamat1985@gmail.com , ankurtraders.lucknow@gmail.com
Website:-www.ankurtrader.com , www.goyalkitchenequipments.com/

An 1SO 9001: 2008 Certified Company
Mfgr. of All types of “Commercial Kitchen & Refrigeration Equipment"

Note: We are authorized dealer of JINDAL STAINLESS STEEL .

We invite you to participate and submit your quotations for attached list of equipment required for Lucknow Street outlets at Terminal-3 of Chaudhary Charan Singh

International Airport, Lucknow.



Your best price would be highly appreciated in stipulated time i.e., on or before 5™ Feb 2024, 15:00 Hrs. IST for our further consideration.
Further to the above, you are requested to take note of the following:
e Company reserves the right to reject any or all the Bids or cancel/ withdraw the tender without assigning any reason whatsoever and in such case no bidder/
intending bidder shall have any claim arising out of such action.
e Company reserves the right to split the requirement in more than 1 agency.
Regards,
Manish Mulchandani
Contracts & Procurement

Cell No. | +91 8105870198

Adani Airport Holdings Limited

Office Address | 6" Floor | East, Commerce House 6, Corporate Road, Off S G Highway, Prahladnagar, Ahmedabad 380 051, Gujarat, India
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DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is
confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this
e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views
or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any
damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is
confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this
e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views
or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any
damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.



