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Re: Tax Invoices

Approved

Best Regards
Samarjit Pani (he/him)
GM, Marketing, Travel Food Services

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 20, 2024 11:13:56 AM

To: Samarjit Pani <samariit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>
Ce: Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Tax Invoices

Need single vendor approval for Adko for 080 & Adani Social Media page for July 2024.

From: Accounts AdKo <accounts@adko.in>
Sent: 08 August 2024 14:45
To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>

Ce: Snehal Jadhav <snehal jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; RISHI UDAPURKAR <rishi@adko.in>
Subject: Tax Invoices

Hi Akshit,

Please find the Tax Invoices for the following: £ Snipping Tool

1. Tax Invoice 24-RIOAUG-10 for 080 Lounge
2. Tax Invoice 24-RIOAUG-11 for Adani Lounge
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