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Trupti Dalvi

From: Amol Dandekar
Sent: 19 January 2024 12:47
To: Trupti Dalvi
Subject: FW: BIAL T2 - KFC Front counter signage

 
 

From: Marcon Signage [mailto:marcondisplay@gmail.com]  
Sent: Friday, January 19, 2024 12:46 PM 
To: Amol Dandekar <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Projects 1 <projects@marconsignage.com> 
Subject: Re: BIAL T2 - KFC Front counter signage 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Hello sir,  
 
The estimate will be- 
 
Type: Non lit Acrylic sign 
5mm Solid Acrylic laser cut letters with red and white PU coating and backside tapes for mounting 
 
Cost: Rs. 6000 + 18% GST 
Packing & Transport: Rs. 1500 
Installation charges: Rs. 2000 
 
Grand Total: Rs. 9,500 + 18% GST 
 
On Fri, 19 Jan 2024, 10:49 Amol Dandekar, <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Dear Yash 

  

We have to make a signage on the front counter refer attached details and kindly share quote for the same. 
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Thanks 

  

Best regards 

  

Amol Dandekar 


