12/19/23, 10:51 AM Mail - Senthil Raj P - Outlook

Re: REG: OPUS Subscription Renewal for 2024

Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Mon 12/18/2023 7:36 PM

To:Dharani Krishna Gavvagi <dharanikrishna@elaachi.com>;Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@blrlounge.in>
Cc:Elaachi Sales <sales@elaachi.com>;Tanmay Adhikari <tanmay.adhikari@blrlounge.in>

Dear Dharni,

Thanks for your support

I am okay with the charges, but just need to get them regularised

Will arrange for a CR PO for the efforts

Hi Senthil,

Please arrange for the PO and submit the invoice for processing

Regards,

Nikhil
9820171661

Get Outlook for Android

From: Dharani Krishna Gavvagi <dharanikrishna@elaachi.com>

Sent: Monday, December 18, 2023 7:19:50 PM

To: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@blrlounge.in>

Cc: Elaachi Sales <sales@elaachi.com>; Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>; Tanmay
Adhikari <tanmay.adhikari@blrlounge.in>

Subject: Re: REG: OPUS Subscription Renewal for 2024

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Senthil,

Our relation is going maximum with oral confirmations and we are also not keenly looking on
commercials if any small changes asked by TFS and any support required after office hours also.

We have agreed ok to provide one api to GM in the month of Jan/feb 2022 where we charged 30k.
After that if you see back and forth mails requirement changes for them to make that API live in BIAL
network or website and you can see all the efforts we put in that till now too. Regarding this | have
informed to Tanmay once on call that efforts we are putting more and there will be extra charges and
he asked me to send mail to Nikhil. Somehow it got carried away and missed.

@tanmay please confirm once.
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| will leave it you Senthil as you are the one mostly worked with us along with GM and BIAL meetings.

On Fri, 15 Dec 2023 at 1:57 AM, Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@blrlounge.in> wrote:
Dear Team,
Could you please share the effort rendered for API part and have sent any commercial proposal for
this activity earlier. If yes kindly share with us once.

Best Regards,

Senthil Raj P.
Sr.Manager - IT.
BLR Lounge Services Pvt Ltd.

© +91 - 9789079708 | @ www.travelfoodservices.com

For support, contact:

Email : bangalore.it@blrlounge.in
Contact No. :®@ +91 - 8657541674

IT Support processes : Please raise an incident/ticket using the links provided below.

Self Service : https://app.assetinfinity.io/login

Disclaimer : Minimal IT Support to be provided without incidents raised.

From: Elaachi Sales <sales@elaachi.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 14, 2023 4:23 AM

To: Tanmay Adhikari <tanmay.adhikari@blrlounge.in>; Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@blrlounge.in>
Cc: Dharani Krishna Gavvagi <dharanikrishna@elaachi.com>

Subject: REG: OPUS Subscription Renewal for 2024

You don't often get email from sales@elaachi.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Tanmay,
Hope you are doing well!!

Thank you again for utilizing our PMS service for your Property.
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Please find the invoice attached for 2024.
Revert if you have any questions or clarifications needed.
Regards,

Sales Team,
Elaachi India Pvt. Ltd
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