Trupti Dalvi

From: Irfan Sayed

Sent: 15 March 2024 09:32

To: Trupti Dalvi; Stephen P

Cc: Suraj Kumbhar; Divesh Tripathi; binu.balachandran; Lovejot Sekhon; Prakash Mistry; Khushbu Verma; Nimisha Jadhav; Akshay Sharma; Shama Nair

Subject: FW: LKO-T3- Food truck dispatch & additional requirement's + Boarding bites laminate and MS support powder coating shade revision

Attachments: IS_Additional work _Quotation_ Mediterranean cart_Lucknow_140324.xIsx; IS_Additional work _Quotation_ Mexican cart_Lucknow_140324.xIsx; IS_Additional work _Quotation_

Boarding Bites PO6_Lucknow_140324.xIsx; IS_Additional work _Quotation_ Boarding Bites P02_Lucknow_140324 xlsx

Dear Trupti
Request you to upload PR for attached costing as per below details for LKO-T3.

e Shawarma Truck

e Burger Truck

e Boarding Bites — P02
e Boarding Bites — P06

Confirm once PR uploaded.

Dear Stephen
Need your support to discuss with Inventech to start working on the above detailing to avoid delay for waiting till PO release for the additional work.

Regards,
Irfan

From: Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>

Sent: Thursday, March 14, 2024 7:48 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>; Inventech Solutions <inventechsolutionspune@gmail.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil

<sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Antim Sharma <antim.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sonali Dhadve

<Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; santosh khake

<project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair

<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon
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Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: LKO-T3- Food truck dispatch & additional requirement's + Boarding bites laminate and MS support powder coating shade revision

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan ji,

In the above shared quotation the water meter is missing.

Please find attached corrected quotations for Boarding bites kiosk and Lucknow carts.

Requesting you to please review and proceed for further process.

Upon approval of the costing and go ahead from the Semolina procurement team we will start the procurement of additional items and building of the barrication.
Thanks & Regards,

SAndeep
Inventech Solutions

INVENTECH

On Thu, 14 Mar 2024 at 15:49, Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net> wrote:

Dear Irfan ji,
Please find attached quotations for Boarding bites kiosk and Lucknow carts.

Requesting you to please review proceed for further process.
Upon approval of the costing and go ahead from the Semolina procurement team we will start the procurement of additional items and building of the barrication.

Thanks & Regards,

SAndeep
Inventech Solutions



INVENTECH

On Wed, 13 Mar 2024 at 16:25, Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Shirish

Please find below Boarding Bites colour shade approvals from Adani team.

Request you to go through the same and do the needful.

Dear Prakash,

As discussed over the phone with you and Siddharth, please find below the approved final colour shades for the outlet-






Regards,

Irfan

From: Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>

Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2024 6:51 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>

Cc: Inventech Solutions <inventechsolutionspune@gmail.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Divesh Tripathi
<divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Antim Sharma <antim.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>; binu.balachandran
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; santosh khake <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>; Ameet Koomar
<Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi
<trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: LKO-T3- Food truck dispatch & additional requirement's + Boarding bites laminate and MS support powder coating shade revision

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan,

Thanks for your mail to confirm the dispatch of the Lucknow Carts material.

We will share the costing for the additional items as mentioned in the email below for Carts and Boarding bites kiosk as early as possible.



Upon approval of the costing and go ahead from the Semolina procurement team we will start the procurement of additional items and building of the barrication.

Once the barrication is ready we will dispatch the carts material.

Before dispatch we will raise the tax invoices for 80% of the project value as per PO terms for both Carts and Boaring bites requesting your approval.

Rectification of boarding bites kiosk issues will be carried out while doing the modifications.

Requesting you to please share the laminate details, powder coating shade and graphics for board out as soon as possible.

Dear Sandeep,

Please align the work and dispatch of the material accordingly. Also discuss with Irfan about water meter to get the clarity and share the costing for the additional items
on priority.

Thanks & Regards,

Shirish



On Tue, 12 Mar 2024, 16:06 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Shirish

Please aligned dispatch of both the food truck with below additional materials.

Shawarma & Burger Truck :-

e Board out to be done with proper flex as per approved artwork from asset design team.
e Electrical & water meter to be added/provided.

Also as discussed, boarding bites laminate, and powder coating confirmation awaited at asset end. We will share the details on approval received on the same from
asset design team. | have already shared the options on the same for costing work.

Note :- Workmanship of currently done boarding bites are pathetic and same is already shared/informed to you and Sandeep.

Boarding Bites :-

e Laminate to be change as per approved shade.
e MS verticals supports powder coating to be change as per approved shade.
e Electrical meter to be added for both Boarding Bites.

All details pertaining to passes and materials in/out already shared, kindly do the needful accordingly.
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Request you to share the additional costing for further processing, meanwhile aligned dispatch accordingly.

Regards,

Irfan

From: Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>

Sent: Monday, March 4, 2024, 11:56 AM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Inventech Solutions <inventechsolutionspune @gmail.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>; Sarvesh
Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu
<jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; santosh khake <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan
<saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Divesh Tripathi
<divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :Semolina/P0O/23-24/000043

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan,
We are awaiting confirmation for the dispatch of the carts material.

Requesting you to please look into the matter on priority and do the needful.



Thanks & Regards,

Shirish

On Tue, 27 Feb 2024, 15:04 Shirish Awati, <shirish@inventechsolutions.net> wrote:

Dear Irfan,

Material for Carts has been ready to be dispatched from few weeks back. We are waiting for your confirmation for the dispatch.

Material is sitting in our inventory for quite some time so requesting you to please arrange for site readiness and provide confirmation for the dispatch and installation
as earliest possible.

Thanks and regards,

Shirish

On Fri, 9 Feb 2024, 09:30 Shirish Awati, <shirish@inventechsolutions.net> wrote:

Dear Irfan,

Thanks for the update.



We will wait for your go ahead to dispatch the material.
Also as our material is ready we will be sharing invoice for 80% of the amount to be paid before dispatch of the material as per PO terms.

In the meantime you can process this payment.

Thanks & Regards,

Shirish

On Fri, 9 Feb 2024, 00:07 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Shirish

Please hold the same for some time as the location is not ready as of now.

Will update you on delivery of the same in coming week.

Regards,

Irfan
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From: Inventech Solutions <inventechsolutionspune@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 8, 2024 10:18 AM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>; Sarvesh Patil
<sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu
<jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; santosh khake <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed
Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :Semolina/P0O/23-24/000043

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan ji,

We are planning to dispatch both carts material on Sunday 10-02-24 and installation will start from 15-02-24.

Please confirm on the same.

We will dispatch the material on your confirmation only.

On Thu, Jan 25, 2024, 9:18 AM Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Stephen

Why it’s taking time to release advances...
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Please share the details of the same.

Regards,

Irfan

From: Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>

Sent: Wednesday, January 24, 2024 9:04 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: Inventech Solutions <inventechsolutionspune@gmail.com>; Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>;
Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; santosh
khake <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot
Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :Semolina/P0O/23-24/000043

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Stephen and Irfan,

Please update on the advance payment status for Lucknow carts.
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Thanks & Regards,

Shirish

On Wed, 17 Jan 2024, 08:37 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Sure Shirish

Dear Stephen

Please process for advance.

Regards,

Irfan

From: Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>
Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2024 8:03 AM
To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Inventech Solutions <inventechsolutionspune@gmail.com>; Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>;
Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu
<jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; santosh khake <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed
Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :Semolina/P0O/23-24/000043
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan,
Thanks for your confirmation.

Requesting you to please process the advance payment as earliest for this order.

Regards,

Shirish

On Wed, 17 Jan 2024, 06:32 Irfan Sayed, <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Shirish/Sandeep

As discussed, & confirm with Akshay, start both LKO-T3 Cart work and aligned delivery of the same within 20 days.

Regards,

Irfan

14



From: Inventech Solutions <inventechsolutionspune@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 4, 2024, 12:39 PM

To: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; santosh khake <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan
Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shirish
Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>; Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :Semolina/P0O/23-24/000043

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Jogeswar,

As discussed over the phone that we had ordered some material for the Carts but it has not been delivered yet so we will put it on hold and wait to hear from you
before proceeding further.

Thanks & Regards,

Shirish

On Thu, 4 Jan 2024, 11:35 Jogeswar Sahu, <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear sir,
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As discussed on call, the orders for Lucknow's two carts, LKN Int Burger Tacos Co & LKN Int Shawarma,Tacos,Burger, are currently on hold due to pending
location handover. Please refrain from operating both carts until we provide confirmation.

Thanks & Regards,
Jogeswar Sahu

+91 9082949517

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Sent: 04 January 2024 11:21

To: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :Semolina/P0O/23-24/000043

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

From: procuresens@safalsoftcom.com <procuresens@safalsoftcom.com>
Sent: 01 January 2024 11:05
To: inventechsolutionspune@gmail.com
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Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>
Subject: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :Semolina/P0O/23-24/000043

M/S INVENTECH SOLUTIONS
Dear Sir / Madam,

Your Purchase Order is now Confirmed.Please Select Option..

PO Details as below

Semolina/P0O/23

PO Number 24/000043

PO Date 27/12/2023
PO Value 1239000.00
Buyer Name Jogeswar Sahu

AccpetfRegret

Best Regards,

Procurement Department
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HOSPITALITY

K Hospitality Corp

1 Rashid Mansion, Worli Point, Mumbai - 400018, India

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply back to this email ID. You are advised to login to K Hospitality Corp for details. We
recommend making your Password confidential as confidentiality is completely supplier’s responsibility.
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