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Samarjit Pani
Re: Tax Invoice 24-RIOJUN-19

Akshit Sogani

Approved
Best Regards

Samarjit Pani (he/him)

GM, Marketing, Travel Food Services

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2024 2:37:39 PM

To: Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Tax Invoice 24-RIOJUN-19

Hi Samarji,
As discussed with Chetan, need Single vendor approval for Thanjavur Shoot for Bangalore Shoot.
Please revert for any clarification

Thank you
Akshit Sogani

From: Accounts AdKo <accounts@adko.in>
Sent: 18 June 2024 14:16
To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: rishi@adko.in
Subject: Tax Invoice 24-RIOJUN-19





