Trupti Dalvi

From: Khushbu Verma

Sent: 16 May 2024 16:30

To: Trupti Dalvi

Cc: Santosh Tambe; Prakash Mistry; Sitaram Mistry

Subject: FW: FW: CCTV BOQ - AHM IDLI.COM T1-SHA BUS GATE
Attachments: Ahemdabad Food Court CCTV BOQ.XLSX

Dear Trupti

Please upload CCTV boq for Idli.com + Dhaba + Nourish and KFC at Ahmedabad T1 Food court.

Regards
Khushbu

From: GAPL <genarchpl@gmail.com>

Sent: 16 May 2024 16:05

To: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: ankit <ankit@genarch.in>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi
<trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: CCTV BOQ - AHM IDLI.COM T1-SHA BUS GATE

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Khushbu,
Please find the attached CCTV quantity on the received format, as required.

Regards
Manpreet Singh

On Wed, May 15, 2024 at 6:54 PM GAPL <genarchpl@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Khushbu,

As discussed, please find the attached ZIP file containing the inventory for KFC, Ildi, Dhaba, and Nourish.
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Thank you and regards,
Manpreet Singh

On Wed, May 15, 2024 at 12:18 PM Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Manpreet

Further to our discussion yesterday, please provide BOQ of CCTV for Idli.com, Dhaba, Nourish and KFC separately based on the BOQ attached.

Please provide the same at the earliest.

Regards

Khushbu

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 14 May 2024 15:58

To: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>

Cec: Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Herambraj Sonawane
<mumbai.purchasel @k-corp.in>; Sitaram Mistry <sitaram.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Viraj Vaghela <viraj.vaghela@semolinakitchens.com>
Subject: FW: CCTV BOQ - AHM IDLIL.COM T1-SHA BUS GATE

Dear Khushbu ,



Kindly ask the consultant to revise the IT BOQ as per this RC format using the specs .

Regards

Santosh TAMBE

From: Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 14 May 2024 13:40

To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>; Capex Purchase <capex.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: CCTV BOQ - AHM IDLL.COM T1-SHA BUS GATE

Dear Santosh sir,

Kindly revised CCTV BOQ of Idli.com as per received RC.

Thanks & Regards,
Trupti Dalvi

Project Coordinator



From: Capex Purchase <capex.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 14 May 2024 13:21

To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com™>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>

Cec: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase l @k-corp.in>

Subject: CCTV RC

Dear Sir,

PFA —RC for CCTV.

Kindly raise PR / BOQ accordingly.

Thanks & Regards

Pramod Singh
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