Smrutika Thoti

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 17 August 2024 14:18

To: Smrutika Thoti

Cc: Dev Joel

Subject: FW: Approval required of Extra Work for Flexible Pipes @ Jamie's Pizzeria & Irish House
Hyderabad Airport

Attachments: Purchase Order.pdf

Dear Smrutika,
Please upload PR

Providing & Fixing testing & Commissioning of braided UL listed FM Approved SS Flexiable Pipe, (Brand Tyco ) 1.6 mtr
Long

1. TIrisj House =22 Nos.
2. Jamie’s Pizzeria =10 Nos
Regards
Shadab Sukri
From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 17 August 2024 02:13 PM

To: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Cc: Farid Khan <farid.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Manish Thakkar Kcorp
<manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Dev Joel <Dev.Joel@gmrgroup.in>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>;
anjlemepprojects@gmail.com; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>; Smrutika Thoti
<smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Approval required of Extra Work for Flexible Pipes @ Jamie's Pizzeria & Irish House Hyderabad Airport

Dear Premkant,
Please go ahead as per attached Work Order rate, we will issue separate Po for same

Regards
Shadab Sukri

From: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Sent: 17 August 2024 01:15 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Farid Khan <farid.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Manish Thakkar Kcorp
<manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Dev Joel <Dev.Joel@gmrgroup.in>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>;
anjlemepprojects@gmail.com; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Approval required of Extra Work for Flexible Pipes @ Jamie's Pizzeria & Irish House Hyderabad Airport

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,



Kindly find the attached PO and check the highlighted item for your reference.

On Sat, Aug 17, 2024 at 12:32 PM <account.anjle@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Only Pizza Hut has installed flexible pipes, but the rate of flexible pipes included with the sprinklers.

Attached PO for your reference.

Kindly share the approval urgently, as the material will take time to arrange.

REGARDS

Priyanka(ADMIN AND ACCOUNTS MANAGER)

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 15" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2N° FLOOR DDA FLAT

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT
NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373
Ext — 31

Mail id —anjlemepprojects@agmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL ,

From: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 17 August 2024 11:15

To: account.anjle@gmail.com; Farid Khan <farid.khan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: 'Stephen P' <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Farid Khan
<farid khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Dev Joel' <Dev.Joel@gmrgroup.in>; binu.balachandran
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; 'Anjle Account Team' <anjleoffice2008@gmail.com>;
anjlemepprojects@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Approval required of Extra Work for Flexible Pipes @ Jamie's Pizzeria & Irish House
Hyderabad Airport
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Dear Premkant,

Please share work order reference if same item executed in any other project

Regards

Shadab Sukri

From: account.anjle@gmail.com <account.anjle(@gmail.com>

Sent: 16 August 2024 03:03 PM

To: Farid Khan <farid.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: 'Stephen P' <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Farid Khan
<farid khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Dev Joel' <Dev.Joel@gmrgroup.in>; binu.balachandran
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; 'Anjle Account Team' <anjleoffice2008@gmail.com>;
anjlemepprojects@gmail.com

Subject: Approval required of Extra Work for Flexible Pipes @ Jamie's Pizzeria & Irish House Hyderabad
Airport

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

As discussed between Mr. Farid and Monif, the flexible pipes are to be installed in Irish House and Jamie's
Pizzeria. This item is not included in the PO and BOQ ,so this is the extra work cost.

Kindly check and send the approval so that we can proceed the work.

1. Irisj House =22 Nos. @2650/- each no.
2. Jamie’s Pizzeria =10 Nos.@2650/-Each No.
REGARDS

Priyanka(ADMIN AND ACCOUNTS MANAGER)



FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 15' YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2"° FLOOR DDA FLAT

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT
NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext — 31

Mail id —anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL ,

THANKS & REGARDS

KIRAN GUPTA

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 20/567 , 3" Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar
MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT

NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext — 31

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL



