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Smrutika Thoti

From: Ranjandas S
Sent: 13 December 2024 17:20
To: Smrutika Thoti; Suraj Kumbhar
Cc: Shama Nair; Suraj Kumbhar; Nimisha Jadhav; Mithilesh Thaokar; anjlemepprojects@gmail.com; Binu Balachandran
Subject: RE: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport 080
Attachments: Extra item.xlsx

Dear Smruthika, 
 
Request to upload the attached extra item of Anjle in Safal 
 
Dear Suraj, 
 
This extra work of AHU is approved by Meptek and Fire hydrant was shifted from live kitchen to BOH corridor. 
 
Binu, 
 
As discussed sent this document to upload in Safal. Please take the supporting documents for the price from vendor. 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
Travel Food Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 
 

From: anjlemepprojects@gmail.com <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 13 December 2024 3:56 pm 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; 
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Mithilesh Thaokar <mithilesh.thaokar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport 080 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Sir, 
 
Waiting. 
 

REGARDS 

PREMKANT RAJPOOT 

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  14th YEAR COMPLETION    

CIN NO-U74999DL2018PTC333864 

OFFICE VENUE -  41/1407 ,  2N D  FLOOR DDA  FLAT 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600  9871770191 

Ext – 31 

Mail id –anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com 

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL , www.anjlemep.com 

 

From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 07 December 2024 05:37 PM 
To: anjlemepprojects@gmail.com; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Mithilesh Thaokar <mithilesh.thaokar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport 080 
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Dear Binu, 
 
Status please. 
 
Mithilesh, 
 
Please follow up and update. 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
Travel Food Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 
 

From: anjlemepprojects@gmail.com <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 7 December 2024 5:35 pm 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Mithilesh Thaokar <mithilesh.thaokar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport 080 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Ranjan Sir, 
 
Po still not received . pls help. 
 

REGARDS 

PREMKANT RAJPOOT 

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  14th YEAR COMPLETION    
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CIN NO-U74999DL2018PTC333864 

OFFICE VENUE -  41/1407 ,  2N D  FLOOR DDA  FLAT 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600  9871770191 

Ext – 31 

Mail id –anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com 

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL , www.anjlemep.com 

 

From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 23 November 2024 07:30 PM 
To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Mithilesh Thaokar <mithilesh.thaokar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Fw: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport 080 
 
 
Dear Binu, 
 
Please find the comments in trial mail from the consultants. Request to check and proceed further. 
Dear Premkant, 
Meptek comments for your records. 
 
Regards 
Get Outlook for Android 

From: Safdar Shaikh <safdar@meptekconsultants.com> 
Sent: Saturday, November 23, 2024 3:56:08 PM 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nimish Shah' <nimish.shah@meptekconsultants.com>; 
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'Sunil Kadam' <sunil.kadam@meptekconsultants.com>; kschandavar@gmail.com <kschandavar@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport 080  
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Sir, 
  
Following are our observation for additional work related to HVAC system. 
  

•         AHU - We have changed the size of AHU from horizontal to vertical due to constraint of AHU room. The proposed horizontal AHU dimension was not fitting in the 
required room size. Hence, we had asked them to change to vertical. 

  
•         VRF ODU - We believe that VRF ODU should be supplied as top-discharge (default) as the same systems was used in Phase-1 also.. Anjle MEP was the HVAC vendor 

who also executed Phase-1, then how did they quote for side discharge? They did not visit the site before bidding and wrongly quoted side discharge ODU. We also 
believe that 34 HP cannot come in side discharge as a single module. This reason for additional cost is not acceptable. 

  
Best Regards, 
  
Safdar Shaikh 
Mobile No. : 9221028008  
  

 
  
502, Padmavati Heights, Shraddhanand Road,  
Navpada, Vile Parle (East), Mumbai - 400 057 
  

From: Ranjandas S [mailto:Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com]  
Sent: Thursday, November 21, 2024 1:29 PM 
To: 'Safdar Shaikh' <safdar@meptekconsultants.com> 
Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimish Shah <nimish.shah@meptekconsultants.com> 
Subject: FW: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport 
  
Gentle reminder 
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Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
Travel Food Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 
  

From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>  
Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2024 12:43 pm 
To: Safdar Shaikh <safdar@meptekconsultants.com> 
Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Safdar Shaikh <safdar@meptekconsultants.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Fw: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport 
  
Dear Safdar, 
Could u please check & revert on this extra item, 
regards 
  
Get Outlook for Android 

From: account.anjle@gmail.com <account.anjle@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 13, 2024 11:34:02 AM 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; anjlemepprojects@gmail.com <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>; 'Anjle 
Account Team' <anjleoffice2008@gmail.com> 
Subject: BOQ of Extra Work fire & HAVC for Domestic Lounge BIAL Airport  
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
  
Dear Sir, 
  
As per site requirements, some additional work is needed, so here we are sharing extra Work BOQ of Fire & HVAC for Domestic Lounge @BIAL Airport. 
  
Kindly review and provide approval so we can proceed further. 
  
REGARDS 
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Priyanka(ADMIN AND ACCOUNTS  MANAGER)                                                                                           
  
FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  15 th YEAR COMPLETION 
  
OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2ND FLOOR DDA  FLAT  
MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 
NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600,  9560072373  
Ext – 31  
Mail id –anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com  
COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL ,   
  


