[5 Outlook

RE: vows and views bills and Po to be made

From Arindam Chakraborty <arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in>
Date Thu 11/14/2024 5:31 PM
To  Pravin Takle <pravin.takle@kapcocatering.com>; Shailendra Jain <shailendra.jain@kapcocatering.com>;

Bhavi Koli <accountsé@kapcocatering.com>; Deepa Sarode <deepa.sarode@kapcocatering.com>; Hemant
Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in>; Pravin Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>

Cc  Harish Tirlotkar <maintenance@kapcocatering.com>; Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>;
Mahendra Shinde <mahendra.shinde@k-corp.in>

Approved !
Arindam Chakraborty s
o Chief Operating Officer L
Catel'lﬂg ‘ B +919152215366
Collective arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in

www.cateringcollective.in
1, Rashid Mansion, Dr Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai - 400018

From: Pravin Takle <pravin.takle@kapcocatering.com>

Sent: 13 November 2024 13:23

To: Shailendra Jain <shailendra.jain@kapcocatering.com>; Bhavi Koli <accountsé@kapcocatering.com>; Deepa
Sarode <deepa.sarode@kapcocatering.com>; Hemant Kajuwalkar <mumbai.purchase@k-corp.in>; Pravin
Panchal <pravin.panchal@kapcocatering.com>

Cc: Harish Tirlotkar <maintenance@kapcocatering.com>; Arindam Chakraborty
<arindam.chakraborty@cateringcollective.in>; Ashay Desai <ashay.desai@cateringcollective.in>; Mahendra
Shinde <mahendra.shinde@k-corp.in>

Subject: vows and views bills and Po to be made

Dear Shailender ,

Please find the attached invoices for palace halls monsoon shed . Bill no 151 is as per PO
balance payment which needs to be done , Bill no 152 is extra measurment and october
extension monsoon shed .

Dear Hemant / Pravin
Please make Posits PO for bill no 152 .

Hi Ashay / Arindam ,
Please approve the same .

Regards
Pravin

From: Dhanraj Soni <dhanraj.vowsandviews@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 5:05 PM

To: Pravin Takle <pravin.takle@kapcocatering.com>

Cc: Kunal Samani <samanikunal@gmail.com>; sanjay@jkbanquets.com <sanjay@jkbanquets.com>;
info.vowsandviews@gmail.com <info.vowsandviews@gmail.com>

Subject: Chk the attachment
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As per the Conversation we had sharing you the PI
Request kindly release the payment

Vows and Views
Wedding / Event Planner

<’ 9819919117 @ NSCI SVP Stadium,D Wing, 1st floor,lotus colony,lala
lajpatrai marg, Worli, Mumbai 400018 E+ info.vowsandviews@gmail.com
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