Smrutika Thoti

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 15 July 2024 12:14

To: Smrutika Thoti

Cc: Farid Khan; Nimisha Jadhav; PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO; binu.balachandran
Subject: RE: For Review Purpose Only (Budweiser Civil)

Dear Smrutika,
Please upload PR for below item — Budweiser Civil

Sr.No. Particulars Unit Qty Rate Amount

P&F of 75mm thick bison board partition with
aluminium framework made with 50X38 mm
hollow pipe of 18 guage. Partition to be fixed
with fasteners on wall , floor and ceiling. Rate to
be inclusive of bison board, aluminium pipe
framework and other necessary hardware as

1 required.

Sq.Ft. 91 550 50050

Regards
Shadab Sukri

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 13 July 2024 07:37 PM

To: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>

Cc: Farid Khan <farid.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: For Review Purpose Only (Budweiser Civil)

Dear Pavan,

Plumbing comments



e Pre rinse installation charge is too high, request you to delete plumbing Additional & raise invoice
Civil

P&F of 75mm thick bison board partition with
aluminium framework made with 50X38 mm
hollow pipe of 18 guage. Partition to be fixed
with fasteners on wall , floor and ceiling. Rate to
be inclusive of bison board, aluminium pipe
framework and other necessary hardware as

1 required.

Sq.Ft. 91 550 50050

Share work order reference for above items & join measurement sheet of above additional items

Regards
Shadab Sukri

From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>

Sent: 13 July 2024 10:40 AM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Farid Khan <farid.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: For Review Purpose Only (Budweiser Civil)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached file for the authorised and verified measurement sheet.

Thanks & regards,

Pavan Sharma



M: +918097344059
M: +919699133757

Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information including
trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an intended recipient,
any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails are susceptible to
alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If you are not the
intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail deletion. Thank you.

On Thu, Jun 27, 2024 at 10:58 PM Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Pavan,

Please share join measurement sheet

Regards

Shadab Sukri

From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>
Sent: 21 June 2024 06:36 PM
To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Farid Khan <farid.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: For Review Purpose Only (Budweiser Civil)




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir/Ma'am,
Please find attached files for Budweiser Civil proforma Invoice
Thanks & regards,

Pavan Sharma

M: +918097344059

M: +919699133757



Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information including
trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an intended recipient,
any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails are susceptible to
alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If you are not the
intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail deletion. Thank you.



