[bookmark: _GoBack][image: ]

image1.png
RReply RReply All (3 Forward
Samarth Rastogi Akshit Sogani

Re: Work invoice

Approved

Get Outlook for Android

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2024 1:42:50 PM

To: Samarth Rastogi <samarth rastogi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Work invoice

Hi Samarth,
Need single vendor approval for this invoice for Website IPO Video editing.

We are developing the videos n content needed for website & IPO with 2 vendors, we will use whichever one gets approved, already discussed with
Karan Kapur.

Please revert for any clarification

Thank you
Akshit Sogani

From: Priya Raj <priyaraj1627 @gmail.com>
Sent: 14 November 2024 10:52

To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Work invoice




