Trupti Dalvi

From: Santosh Tambe

Sent: 11 August 2024 16:39

To: Trupti Dalvi; stephen.p@k-corp.in; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp

Cc: Shama Nair; Akshay Sharma; Sitaram Mistry; Prakash Mistry; Khushbu Verma; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp; Suraj Kumbhar; projects@goldfingers.in; info@goldfingers.in;
huzaifa.h.gfepl@gmail.com; abhijit.s@goldfingersest.com; eswar.gfepl@gmail.com; bipin.gfepl@gmail.com; Shyam Sunder Pandey

Subject: FW: Approval for Extra works & non PO Items

Attachments: EXTRA WORK T1- CIP LOUNGE 09.08.24.pdf

Dear Trupti

Kindly raise a PR for the Additional Dismantling items at cip Lounge AHMBD which is done by M/s Gold fingers , measurement sheet attached FYR

Aside Stephen — Kindly check on the rates of the same and finalize

Regards
Santosh TAMBE

From: Sami Mohiuddin Ansari <sami.gfepl@gmail.com>

Sent: 10 August 2024 15:34

To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: projects@goldfingers.in; info@goldfingers.in; huzaifa.h.gfepl@gmail.com; abhijit.s@goldfingersest.com; Sitaram Mistry <sitaram.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>;
eswar.gfepl@gmail.com; bipin.gfepl@gmail.com; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Shyam Sunder Pandey <sspandey.gfepl@gmail.com>
Subject: Approval for Extra works & non PO ltems

Some people who received this message don't often get email from sami.gfepl@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Santosh,
PFA of the extra work quotation along with the abstract & signed measurement sheet.

Please let us know if there is any further information or documentation required to expedite the process.

Thank you for your prompt attention to this matter.



Best Regards,

Sami Mohiuddin Ansari
Gold Fingers Est. Pvt. Ltd.
General Manager

+91 9040878779



