Sadhasivam K

From: Nikhil Bhushan

Sent: 22 December 2023 11:58

To: Sadhasivam K

Cc: Samrat Narvekar; Venu Madhav Singaraju
Subject: RE: Surface Tab Go3 for Martini Bar T2
Approved

We may need additional approval from Business Finance, if this was not part of the budget
Regards,

Nikhil
+91 9820171661

From: Sadhasivam K <sadhasivam.k@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 22 December 2023 11:52

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Surface Tab Go3 for Martini Bar T2

Importance: High

Dear Nikhil,
As we discussed In Meeting Operation Need One Surface Tab for Martini Bar T2 Kindly Approve to Rise PR.

Thanks & regards
Sadhasivam



