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Samarth Rastogi Akshit Sogani 141

RE: Invoice ,

Approved

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2024 12:33 PM

To: Samarth Rastogi <samarth.rastogi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Invoice

Hi Samarth,

Need single vendor approval for recipe book for 4 brands, as discussed with Chetan.

Thank you
Akshit Sogani

From: Priya Raj <priyaraj1627 @gmail.com>
Sent: 11 December 2024 12:30

To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Invoice

Dear sir





