_Sowri Raja

From: Karthick K

Sent: 06 August 2024 16:48

To: Sowri Raja :
Subject: RE: Need approval on quotation for making new PR

Please raise the PR for the same..

Regards,
Karthick

From: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 06 August 2024 11:32

To: Karthick K <karthick. k@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Need approval on quotation for making new PR

Dear Sir

Please find below quotation received from Ms Shah Enterprises for Terminal 1 DFC Curry kitchen Front Counter gaps to be closed with cupboards, details below




Providing & fixing
cabinet on counter with
1 |2 door top of the counter
is granite finish and the
size is 800mmx1.2mm

no's

1.00

35000.00

35000

Regards,
Sowri Raja
Travel Food Services chennai Pvt, Ltd.




